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Bid Number 50 -00133965

ONE TIME PURCHASE OF VETERINARY SUPPLIES
FOR JEFFERSON PARISH ANIMAL SHELTER

3/26/2021 AT 11:00 AM

ATTENTION VENDORS!!!

Please review all pages and respond accordingly, com

plying with all provisions
in the technical specifi

cations and Jefferson Parish instructions for Bidders and

General Terms and Conditions. All bids must be received on the Purchasing
Department’s eProcurement site, www.ieffparishbids.net, by the bid due date
and time.

Buyer Name: Brenda Bellow, Buyer !}
Buyer Email: bbellow@jeffparish.net
Buyer Phone: 504-364-2683




INVITATION TO BID Page: 1

DATE: 3rg/2024 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER
BID NO.: 50-00133855 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O.BOX ¢
GRETNA, LA, 700540009
§04-364-2678
VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: BRELLOW@®jefiparish.net

Bids will be received until 11:00 AM, 3/26/2021 via online at www.jeffparishbids.net.

LATE BIDS WILL KOT BE ACCEPTED
NOTE: ONLY BIDS WRITTEN IN INK OR TYPEWRITTEN, AND PROPERLY SIGNED BY A MEMBER OF THE FIRM OR AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE, WILL BE ACCEFTED, PENCIL AND/OR PHOTOSTATIC FIGURES OR SIGNATURES SHALL RESULT IN BID REJECTION,
HOWEVER, ELECTRONIC SIGNATURES AS DEFINED IN L5A - RS%G?!%\%?}%SE) ARE ACCEPTABLE. SIGNATURE MUST BE A SECURED DIGITAL

All pids submitted are subject to these instructions and general conditions and any special cengifions and specifications contained herein, ail of which
are made part of this bid proposai reference, By submitting 2 bid, vendar agrees 1o comply with all provisions of Louisiana Law, as well be in X
compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of Ethics, applicable Jefferson Parish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish
Resoiution No. 113646 andfor Resolution No. 113847 as amended, A copg of these resolutions may be obtained from the Office of the Parigh Clerk,
Suite 8700, Jefferson Parish General Govemrment Building, 200 Derbigny 3treet, Gretna, LA 70053, You may also cbtain a copy by visiting the
Purchasing Department webpage at purchasing jeffoarish nat and clicking on Oneline forms.

Jefferson Parish is exempt from paying sales tax under LSA-R.S. 47:301 {8)(c}). All prices for purchases by Jeffersen Parish of supplies and materials
shall be quoted in the unit of measure specified and urdess olherwise specified, shall be exclusive of stateé ang local taxes, The price quoted for work
shali be stated in figures, In the everd there is a difference in unit prices and totals, the unit price shalf prevall. Quotations shal be based on F.O.B,
Delivered, amywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department, JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID ONLY FROM
EACH VENDOR. ltems bid must meet specifications. JEFFERSON PARISH wil accept ene price for each tem unless otherwise indicated. Two of rrore
prices for one item will result in bid rejection. Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/or complete and return the asseciated

line item p?dng forms as indicated. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event there is 8 difference in unit prices and totals, the unit
prices shall prevail

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right {0 award contracts or piace orders on a ump strn or individual #em basis, or such combination, as shall in its
judgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH, Every contrast of order shall be awarded to the LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE
BIDDER, taking into consideration the CONFORMITY WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS and the DELIVERY ANDIOR COMPLETION DATE

PROTESTS: Onty those vendors that submit bids in response to this solicitation may protest any element of the procuremend, in wriling to the Director of
the Purchasing Department. Written protest most be received within 48 hours of the release of fhe bid tabulation by the Purchasing Depariment, After
cehsultation, the Parish Attomay’s Office will then respond to protests in writing. (For more information, please see Chapter 2, Article VI, Division 2, Sec.
2:514.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.)

JEF‘FERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancet alf or any part of an order if not shipped prompﬂé. No charges will be aliowed for parking or cartage
unless specified in the quotation. The order must not be filled af a higher price than quoted. JEFF SON PARISH reserves the right to cance! at any
time and for any reason by Issuing a THIRTY (30} day written notice Io the contractor,

JEFFE_RSON PARISH raquires all products o be new {current) and all werk must be performed according to standard practices for the project, Unfess
ctherwise specified, no aftermarket parts will be acceptad. Unless othensise specified, all workmanship and materials must have at least one {1} year
guarz_mtty, in wriling, from the date of delivery andjor acceptance of the project. Any deviatiens or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on
the bid form for each item angd upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department,

If this bid requires a pre-bid conference (see Additional Requirements section), bidders ara advised that such conference will be held to aiow bidders the
Spportunity to identify any discrepancies in the big specifications and seek furlher clarification regarding instructions. The Purchasing Department will
iSsue 3 written respaonse 1o bidders Questions in the form of an Addendurm,

Alf formal Addenda require written acknowledgment on the bid form by the bidder by the bidder placing the Addendum number in the appropriate
section. Failure to acknowledge an Addendum on the bid form shall cause the bid fo be rejected: JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid
to next lowest responsive ang responsible bidder in this event,

USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the purpose of
establishing certain rinimum standards of quaiity. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided trand names and
stock numbers are spetified. Complete product data may be required prior to award,

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.




DATE: 3192021
Page: 2
BID NO.: 5000133965

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

Bidders are not to exciude from participation in, deny the benefits of o subject to discrimination under any program or activity, any

person in the United States on the grounds of race, color, national ongin, of sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age
Discrimination Act of 1975, or with respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the
Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except that any exemption from such

basis of refigion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1984, or Title VI and Vi of the Act of Aprii 11 1868, shall aiso apply. This

. (), (e), and (K}(5} of the Regulations, New construction or renavakon projects must

1. All bidders must attend the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and will be required to sign in and out as evidence of
attendance. In accordance with LSA R.S. 38:2212(1), all prospective bidders shall be present at the beginning of the
MANDATORY pre-bid conference and shail remain in attendance for th

@ duration of the conference. Any prospective
bidder who fails to attend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited from submitting & bid for the
project,

2. Aftendance to this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not
relieve the bidder of resgonsibility for information discussed af the conference. Furthermore, Gilure o atterd
the pre-bid conference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing
materials or performing any work that may be raquired to complete the work in accerdance with the specification
with no additional cost 1o the owner.

4. A LA State Contractor's License wil be required in accordance with LSA RS, 372150 et seq. and such license

number will be shown on the outside of the bid elecironic envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid 10 be
-re}ected: Wher submitting the bid electronically, the license number must be entered in the appropriate field in the
electronic procurement system. Failure ¢ comply will cause the bid to be rejected.
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Page: 3
INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

tis the bidder's responsibility to visit the job site and evaluate the job before subrmitting a bid.

- Job site must be clean and free of all litter and debris daily and upon completion of the contract Passageways must be kept

clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at all times, Flammable material must be removed fram the iob site daily
because storage wili not be permitted on the premises. Precaution must be exercised at all times to safequard the welfaré of
JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: All awards for public works in excess of $5,000.00 will be reduced to a format contract which shall be
recorded at the contractor’s expense with the Clerk of Court ang Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson, A
price list of recordation costs may be obtained from the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officic Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of
Jefferson. All awards in excess of $25,000.00 wil require both a performance and & payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in
the bid specificafions, the performance bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Unless otherwise state in the bid
specifications, the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Both bonds shalf be supplied at the signing
of the contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the

contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be supplied at the signing of the
contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the
contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be supplied at the signing of the
contract,

All bidders must comply with the requirements stated in the attached "Standard Insurance Requirements” sheet attached to this
bid solicitation. Failure to comply with this ingtruction wilf result in bid rejection.

A bid bond wili be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, uniess otherwise stated in the bid
specifications. All sureties must be in original format (no copies). When submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an )
electronic bid bond through the respective onfine tlearinghouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the elecironic bid

sogcitaﬁpn on Central Auction House, No scanned paper copies of any bid bond will be accepled as part of the electronic bid
submission.

This is an as needed basis contract. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no representations on warranties with regard to minimum
guaranteed quantities unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications.

Freight charges should be included in fotal cost when quoting. if not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be quoted as a
separate lem. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not indicated on bid form,

puiposes, all bidders must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits,
including: Non-Conviction Affidavit, Non-Coliusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and
E-Veerify Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitied PUBLIC WORKS
BID AFFIDAVET. This affidavit must be submitted in ifs original format, and withaut material alteration, in order to be compiiant
and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be

NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with the provisions
cortained in LSA ~ RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-825 1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, For bidding purposes, all bidders
must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Nen-Coliusion
Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and Carmpaign Contribution Affidavit For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have
been combined into one form entitied NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its origing]
format, and without materia! afteration, i order to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive, A scanned copy of
the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with the big, however, the successhl bidder must
submit the original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon confract execution. Failure to comply will
result in the bid submission being rejected as flon-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the aext lowest
Tesponsive and responsibie bidder in this event.




DATE: 3Ms/2021

BID NO.: 50-00133965 Page: 4
INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

16. The ensuing contract for this bid solicitasion may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement andfor Federal funding/reimbursement.
As such, the referenced appendix will be applicable accordingly and shafl be considered part of the bid documents. All
appiicable certifications must be duly completed, signed and submi%ed with hid submission. Failure to submit applicable

17.  For this project, the Contractor shall not pay any state or local sales or use taxes on materials and eguipment which are
affixed and made part of the immovable property of the project or which is permanently incorporated in the project {hereinafter
referred to as “applicable materials and equipment"}, All purchases of applicable materials or equipment shall be made by the
contractor on behalf of and as the agent of Jeffersen Parish {Owner), a poliical subdivision of the State of |ouisiana. No state and
local sales and use taxes are owed on applicable materiais and equipment under the provisions of Act 1029 of the 1991 Regular
Session - Louisiana Revised Statute 47:301(8)(c). Owner will furnish to contractor a certificate form which certifies that Owner is
not required to pay such state or local sales and use taxes, and contractor shall furnish a copy of such certificate to all vendors or
suppliers of the applicable materials and equipment, and report to Owner the amount of taxes not incurred,

it shall be the duty of every parish officer, employee, department, agency, spocial district, board, and commission: and the
duty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish,gand ¥he %uty of every rapplicént for certification of
eligibility for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audH, inspection,
performance raview, or hean{ig pursuant to Jeffarson Parish Caode of Ordinances Section 2-155.1 0(19), By submitting a
bid, vendor acknowledges this and will ablide by all provisions of the referenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances,




INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  3/19/2021 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 5
BID NO.: 50-00133965 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0.BOX 8

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-354-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: BBELLOW
Midwest Veterinary Supply

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 1-2 Business Days

INDICATE STARTING TIME {(IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to
acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: NA

NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) _NA

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:

Midwest Veterinary Supply
SIGNATURE: TITLE:

(Must be signed here) Q'}A, s oar Account Coordinator
PRINT OR TYPE NAME:

Ali Davis

ADDRESS:

21467 Holyoke Avenue
CITY, STATE: ZIP:

Lakeville, MN 55044

TELEPHONE: FAX

©52+567-6253 (952-894-5407
EMAIL ADDRESS:

mvsbids@midwestvet.net

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § 14.854.22




DATE: 31972021

Paga: [
INVITATION TOQ BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00133965 SEALED 81D
Ndj,;fgéa QUANTITY um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES UQ’JJT‘};SE TOTALS
ONE TIME PURCHASE OF VETERINARY SUPPLIES
FOR JEFFERSON PARISH ANIMAL SHELTER
1 10.00 EA 0010 B0ML LUER LOCK SYRINGES, BOX OF 50 $11 .80 $116.00
-001.12250.2
-Box of 25ct )
2 £0.00 EA 0020 YORK LAB WASH BOTTLES, CLEAR 1602 No Rid Ngo Bid
(WITH L SHAPED SPOUT) (GRANGER)
3 100 EA 0030 ALPHA-TRAC2 GLUCOSE MONITOR $61.20 $61.20
-004.00258.02
4 300, EA 0040 ALPHA-TRAGZ TEST SRIPS, 25 PER $57 .44 $172.32
BOTTLE
-004.00273.2
5 10.00 cs 0050 PURINA FORTIFLORA GANINE PROBIOTICS $113.94 $1.139.40
40 PACKET PER BOX, 6 BOX PER CASE
-578.01515.5
& 10.00 cs 0060 PURINA FORTIFLORA FELINE PROBIGTICS $113.94 $1,138.40
40 PACKET PER BOX, 6§ BOX PER CASE
-578.01535.5
7 10.00]  BTL 0070 DRONCIT (PRAZIQUANTEL} §6.8 MG/ML No Bid No Bid
20 ML BOTTLE
8 3.06] BTL 0080 MELOXICAM 1.5 MG/ML 180ML BOTTLE $95.15 $285.45
-153.00942.3
. -200mi
4.00 GL 0090 ISCPROPYL ALCOHOL T0%, GALLON £6.40 $25 60
-193.33240.3
10 2000, BX 0100 #10 SURGICAL BLADES, 100CT BOX $22.71 $454.20
-290.00045.2
1 2000 BTL 0110 ISOFLURANE LIQUID ANESTHETIG, 2
o ISoFLL 40 $25.31 $506.20
-193.33165.3
12 2.00! BTL 0120 METRONIDAZOLE 500MG TABLETS, 100CT 8 12 $16.24
-181.52560.3
13 200, BTL 0130 METRONIDAZOLE 250MG TABLETS, 100GT $4.68 TG 268
-191.52500.3
14 20000  BTL 0140 MAL-AKET PLUS OR TRIZEDTA EAR FLUSH $10.13 £202.60

40Z BOTTLES
-247.55100.3




DATE: 3/18f202%

Page: 7
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00133365 SEALED BID
1
N&EQER QUANTITY | um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES ”255}“‘53& TOTALS
15 5.00] GL 0150 CHLORHEXIDINE 2% SOLUTION (BLUE) $10.38 $51.90
(NOT SHAMPOO) 1 GALLON
-193.08855.3
16 000  BTL 0160 KETOHEX SHAMPOO, 160Z BOTTLES No Bid No Bid
17 40.00| TUBE 0170 TERRAMYCIN OPTHALMIC OINTMENT, 3.5 $14.85 $594.00
GRAM TUBES
-555.00250.3
18 6.00{ BTL 0180 COSEQUIN CANINE JOINT SUPPLEMENTS 254 15 $324.90
100CT BOTTLES OR LARGER
-193.10730.3
19 16.00]  PK 0180 SELAMECTIN (SELARID OR REVOLUTION $74.95 $1,199.20
0-5.8 DOSE
-053.70050.3
-Revolt 3 DS
20 200 PK 0200 SELAMECTIN (SELARID OR REVOLUTION) $157.25 $1.258.00
5-15 LB DOSE
-053.70025.3
2t .0 =
4.00 L g:g}g_r igﬁnmsous 20 MG TABLETS 1000 TAR $78.69 $314.76
-191.57380.3
22 1.00] BTL 0220 PREDNISOLONE 5MG 1000 TAB BOTTLE $45.17 $45.17
-193.62510.3
22 2000 BT 0230 DIPHENHYDRAMINE 25MG CAPS 160CT $2.92 $5.84
-191.41100.3
24 400 BM 240 B
g oméYTRIUENROFLOXACIN E8MG TABS 50CT SRE 71 $266 84
-193.30021.3
25 800 BTL 0250 PANACUR POWDER $349 80 $2.098.80
-349.65100.3
26 1.00{ BTL 0260 URINE DIPSTICKS 243 10 $43 10
-350.11572.2
a7 $.00| JAR 8 3,
g(zfg RAE&V.?& Ffuz.r—‘mmzzua CREAM, USP 1% 54.97 $29.82
-191.59900.3
23 2000 BTL
92132 r};nTAgéﬁg? INJECTABLE 1000MCG $4.54 $9.08
-193.86260.3




DATE: 3/18/2021

Paga: 8
INVITATION TO BI) FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00132965 SEALED BID
@LE?ER QUANTITY | Um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES “Qﬂf;ggﬁ TOTALS
29 200 BT 0290 DEXAMETHASONE SODIUM PHOSPHATE $30.12 $60.24
INJECTABLE, 100ML BOTTLE, SMG/ML
-191.13211.3
20 20.00 BX 0300 2-0 PDO (POLYDIOXANONE) MONOFILAMEN $56.10 $1.122.00
T SUTURE, REVERSE GUTTING
-193.61631.2
31 20.00 BX 0310 3.0 DO (PCLYDIOXANONE) MONOFILAMEN $58.10 $1.122.00
T SUTURE, REVERSE CUTTING
-193.61632.2
32 20,00 BX 0320 4-0 PDO (POLYDIOXANONE) MONOFILAMEN 53 89 %1 077.80
T SUTURE, REVERSE CUTTING
-193.61634.2
33 20.00 Bx 9330 0 PDO (POLYDIOXANONE) MONGFILAMENT $£55 .14 €1 102.80
SUTURE, REVERSE CUTTING
-193.61630.2
3 2.00 cs 0340 AAMI LEVEL 3 STERILE SURGICAL GOWN No Rid No Bid

SMALL/MEDIUM (ITEM#9505} CASE OF 20

BHIP TO: JEFFERSON PARISH ANIMAL SHELTER
Z701 LAPLACO BLVD,
HARVEY, LA, 70058




