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Place a Bid for 5000118066 - QUANTITY OF VARIOUS HARDWARE AND SUPPLIES

Please enter your best bid proposal for this project

Louisiana Contractor ID#

Enter all information required on the outside of the sealed envelope in the box below

1]

B

Jefferson Parish Government

Quantity of Various Hardware and Supplies
Bid #50-00118066

10-27-2016 at 11:00 am

Coburns Supply

1849 Commercial Drive
Harvey, LA 70058

Bid Bond #

Jefferson Parish Vendor #:

Upload Attachment(s)

While this site uccepts various file tvpes. sizes and quantities. the preferred method for delivering all of the appropriate and

required bid documents is one single scanned PDF file. Vendars submitting bids with multiple uploaded imagesiphotos of hid

https://www.centralauctionhouse.com/Do/ShowBidForm/39503898/12823 10/27/2016
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responses are seiely responsible for clarity, [f uploaded images/documents are not fegible. the bidder™s submission will be rejected,
Pleuse note all requirements in this bid package for electronic bid submission.

Upload a file
Click the Upload button in order to upload bid related documents
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§000118066 - QUANTITY OF VARIOUS HARDWARE AND SUPPLIES
Jefferson Parish Government

P:oject documents obtained from www.CentraiBidding.com
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Bid Number 50-00118066

QUANTITY OF VARIOUS HARDWARE AND SUPPLIES

BID DUE: OCTOBER 27, 2016 AT 11:00 AM

Piease review all pages and respond accordingly, compiving with all

ATTENTION VENDORS!H

provisions

in the techni:

al specifications and Jefferson Parish Instructions for Bidders and

General Ter

ms and Conditions. Al bids must be received in the Purchasing

Department by the bid due date and time.

Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street
General Government Building, Suite 4400
Gretna, LA 70053
Buyer Name: Misty A. Camardelle
Buyer Email: mcamardelle@jeffparish.net
Buyer Phone: 504-364-2683
FAX: 504-364-2693




INVITATION TO BID Page: 1
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

BID NO.: 50-00118066 JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O.BOX 9
GRETNA, LA, 70054-0009
504-364-2678

DATE:  10/13/2016

[ VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: MCAMARD

Bids will be received untit 11:00 AM, 10/27/2016via fax: 504-364-2693 or via online at www.jeffparish.net

All bids submitted are subject to these instructions and general conditions and any special conditions and specifications contained
herein, all of which are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting & bid, vendor agrees to comply with all

provisions of Louisiana Law, as well be in compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of

Ethics, applicable Jefferson Pa:ish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish Resolution Na. 113646 and/or Resolution

IHo. 113647. A copy of these ressolutions may be obtained from the Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700,

Jefferson Parish General Govenment Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053. You may also obtain a copy by visiting the
Purchasing Department webpege at www. purchasing jeffparish.net and clicking on On-line forms.

All vendors submitting bids should register as a Jefferson Parish vendor if not already yet registered. Registration forms may be
downloaded from www.purzhasing.jeffparish.net and by clicking on Vendor information. While Jefferson Parish may have these on
file, all bidders should furnish their current W-9 Form and respective Tax Identification Numbers with bid submission; records on file
may be invalid or expired. The successful bidder must submit 2 W-8 Form and respective Tax Identification Number upon conirant
execulion. Failure to do s¢ may result in delay of payment.

~As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana {axing body.
Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Delivered, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Depariment.
JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID ONLY FROM EACH VENDOR. items bid must meet specifications. JEFFERSON
PARISH wilt accept one price for each item unless otherwise indicated. Two or more prices for one item will resutt in bid rejection.
Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/or complete and return the associated line item pricing forms as

inhdiﬁated. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event therz is a difference in unit prices and fotals, the unit prices
shall prevait,

JEFFERSON PARISH reserve:: the right to award contracts or place orders on a lump sum or individual item basis, or such
combination, as shall in its judgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH. Every contract or order shall be awarded to the
LOWEST RESPONSIVE and FESPONSIBLE BIDDER, taking into consideration the CONFORMITY WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS and
the DELIVERY AND/OR COMFLETION DATE

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an arder if not shipped promplly. No charges will be allowed for
parking or cartage unless specified in the quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH
reserves the right to cancel at z ny time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contracior,

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products to be new (current) and all work must be performed according to standard practices for the
project. Uniess otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts will be accepted. Unless otherwise specified, all workmanship and materials
inust have at least one (1) year guaranty, in writing, from the date of delivery and/or acceptance of the project.  Anv deviations ar
alterations from the specifications must be indicated and/or supporting documentation supplied with bid submission.

f this bid requires a pre-bid corderence (see Additional Requirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be held to
allow bidders the opportunity tc identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek further clarification regarding instructions,
“he Purchasing Department wil issue a written response to bidders’ questions in the form of an Addendum.

All formal Addenda require writien acknowledgment on the bid form by the bidder. Failure to acknowledge an Addendum on the bid
forrg shall cause the bid to be rzjected; JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to next lowest responsive and responsible
idder in this event.

‘JSE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the purpese of
sstablishing certain minimum s:andards of quality. Bids may be submitted for praducts of equal quality, provided brand names and
stock numbers are specified. Camplete product data may be required prior to award.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.

3idders are not ta exclude from participation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or aclivity, any
nerson in the United States on the grounds of race, color, national origin, of sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age
Jiscrimination Act of 1975, or viith respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the
Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or 01 the basis of religion, except that any exemption from such prohibition against discrimination on the
asis of religion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1964, or Title V1 and VIi of the Act of April 11, 1968, shall also apply. This
assurance includes compliance with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final handicapped discrimination
orovisions contained in Sectior: 51.55 (c), (d), (e), and (k)(5) of the Regulations, New construction or renovation projects must comply
#ith Section 504 of the 1973 R:shabilitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American National Standard Institute’s
specifications (ANSI Al 17.1-1£61).



DATE:  16/13/2016

P . 2
BID NO.: 50-00118966 rage

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT
TO ALL VENDORS

This eiectronic procurernent system allows vendors the convenience of reviewing and submitting bids online.
This is a secure site znd authorized personnel have limited read access only. Bidders are encouraged to
submit electronically using this free service; while the website accepts various file types, one single PDF fiie
containing zii appropriate and required bid documents is preferred. Bidders submitting uploaded images of
bid responses are solely responsible for clarity. If uploaded images/documents are nof legible, then bidder’s
submission will be reiected. Please note all requirements contained in this bid package for electronic bid
submission.

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE
CORRESPONDING INSTRUGCTIONS BELOW.

13

1. All bidders must attend the MANDATORY pre-hid conference and will be required to sign in and out as evidence of
altendance. In accordance with LSA R.S. 38:2212(1), all prospective bidders shall be present at the beginning of the
MANDATORY pre-bid conference and shall remain in attendance for the duration of the conference. Any prospeciive
bidder who fails to atend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited from submitting a bid for the
project.

2. Atiendance 1o this pie-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not
relieve the bidder of responsibility for information discussed at the conference. Furthermore, failure to attend
the pre-bid conference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of fumishlng

materials or performing any work that may be required to complete the work in accordance with the specification
with no additional cost to the owner.

3. Contractor must hold current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Department of Inspection and
Code Enforcement. Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH
Department of Inspestion and Code Enforcement. The contractor shall be responsible for the payment of
these permits. All permits must be obtained prior to the start of the project. Contractor must aiso hold any
and all epplicable Federal and State licenses. Contractor shall be responsible for the payment of these permits

and shalf obtain thera prior to the start of the project.

4. A LA State Contractor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et. seq. and such license
number will be shown on the outside of the bid envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.,
Additionally if submitting the bid electronically, then the license number must be entered in the appropriats field
in the Electronic Prosurement system. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.

5. ltis the bidder's responsibility to visit the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.

6. Job site must be cleun and free of all litter and debris daily and upon completion of the contraci.
Passageways must be kept clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at all times. Flammable material
must be removed from the job site daily because storage will not be permitted on the premises. Precautions
must be exercised a! all times to safeguard the welfare of JEFFERSON PARISH ang the general public.



CATE: 101372048

EID NO.: 50-00118066 Page: 3
. INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

7. PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: Afl awards for public works in excess of $5,000.00 will be reduced to a formai
contract which shall be recorded at the contractor's expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of
Morigages for the Parish of Jefferson. A price list of recordation costs may be obtained from the Clerk of Court
and £x-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. All awards in excess of $25,000.00 will require both a
performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the performance bond requirements shall
be 100% of the contract price. Unless otherwise state in the bid specifications, the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of
the contraci price. Both bonds shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.

8. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BiDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will ba
100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract.

8. NON-PUBLIC WORKS EIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be
100% of the contract prica unless ofherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shail be
supplied at the signing of the contract,

10. Unless otherwise stated i1 the bid specifications, the successful bidder will be required to procure standard insurance policies
evidencing Parish-mandated insurance requirements as indicated on the attached “insurance requirements” sheel. All bidders
must comply with the inst-uctions in this sheet. Failure to comply will cause bid to be rejected.

11. A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications. Accepiabla forms shall be limited to cashier's check, certified check, or surety bid bond. Al sureties must be in
original format (no copies). If submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an electronic bid bond through the respective online
clearinghouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the electronic bid solicitation on Central Auction Mouse No
scanned paper copies of any bid bond will be accepted as part of the electronic bid submission.

12. This is a requirements ccntract to be provided on an as needed basis. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no
representations on warraties with regard to minimum guaranteed quantities uniess otherwise stated in the bid
specifications.

13. Freight charges should be inciuded in total cost when quoting. if not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be
quoted as a separate iterr. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not
indicated on bid form.

14. PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - {>ompleted, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required; This applies to all solicitations for
construction, alteration or demolition of public buildings or projects, in conformity with the provisions contained in LSA-RS
38:2212.9, LSA-RS 38:2212.10, LSA-RS 38:2224, and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Qrdinances. For bidding
purpases, all bidders mus: submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including:
Non-Conviction Affidavit, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and E-Verify
Affidavit. For the convenisnce of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitled PUBLIC WORKS BiD
AFFIDAVIT. This affidavi: must be submitted in its original format, and without materiaj alteration, in order to be compliant and for
the bid to be considered rasponsive. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted
with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration
upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves
the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

15. NON PUBLIC WORK BID3 - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with the provisions
contained in LSA ~ RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, alf bidders
must submil with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Non-Coliusion
Affidavit, Debt Disclosures. Affidavit and Campaign Contribution Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have bean
combined intc one form entitled NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its criginal format, and
without material afteration in order fo be comptiant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completad,
signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original
affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the big
submission being rejectec as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and
respansible bidder in this svent.

16. The ensuing contract for this bid solicitation may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement and/or Federal funding/reimbursement. As
such, the referenced appendix will be applicable accordingly and shall be considered a part of the bid documents. All applicable
certifications must be duly completed, signed and submitted with bid submission. Failure to submit applicable certifications with
bid submission will result i1 bid rejection.

It shall be the duty of ever/ parish officer, employee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission: and the
duty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every appiicant for certification of
eligibitity for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, inspection,
performance review, or he aring pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Crdinances Section 2-1 55.10(19). By submitting a
bid, vendor acknowledges this and will abide by all provisions of the referenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.




INVITATION TO BID
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4

JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O0.BOX 9
GRETNA, LA, 70054-0009
504-364-2678

DATE: 10/13/2016

BID NO.: 56-00118056

{ VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: MCAMARD

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq , all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing

hody. Quotations shall be bzsed on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Degartment.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel ali or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges wiil be
allowed for parking or cartag: unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30} day writien
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSOM PARISH is expesting all products fo be new and all work is to be done in a workman-iike manner, according

to standard practices. Any doviations or alterations from the specifications must be indicated and backup dosumentation
supplied with your quotation.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 10-14 days

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

i

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must

acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure fo acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form wilt result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:

NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicabie)

" ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW *** |
FIRM NAME:
Coburn’s Supply
SIGNATURE: T T e
(st ve signed nerey 7 ) 1 Aio e L’L / OSR
4

PRINT OR TYPE NAME
Michael Selif

ADDRESS:
1849 Con mercial Drive

CITY, STATE:
Harvey, LA

ZiP:
70058

TELEPHCONE:
{504 }1348-2042

FAX:
( $04 348-1095

EMAIL ADDRESS:
ms:2lf@cobums.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS:

$ 5,373.00




DATE: 10/93/2018

BID NO.: 50-00148066

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

Lim

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

30.00

180.00

24.00

30.00

36.00

72.00

36.00

360.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

QUANTITY OF YARIOUS HARDWARE AND
SUPPLIES

0010 CLAMP HOSE, STAINLESS STEEL, 1/2
INCH BY 1-1/8 INCH RANGE, HEX SCREW,

SK NUMBER 00-0301800 1/2" - 1 1/4"
0020 PAINT MARKING, INVERTED,

FLOURESCENT CAUT!ON BLUE, 17 OUNCE,
KRYLON NUMBER 03620

SK NUMBER 80-0329550
0030 ADAPTER, HYDRANT NOSE NOZZLE

2-1/2 INCH NST BY 2 INCH MIP, ROCKER

LUG, DOMESTIC HEAVY RED BRASS, DIXON
NUMBER RHA2520T-D

SK NUMBER 00-038009F

0040 LANIP, METAL -X-VAPER, 320 WATTS,
PULSE START, CLEAR, DAMAR NUMBER
M320W/U/BT28/PS14K, ITEM NUMBER 265644
SK NUMBER 00-038009F

0050 COOLER, WATER, 2 GALLON CAPACITY,
ALL PLASTIC, FDA GRADE LINER, PUSH

BUTTON SPIGOT, BAIL HANDLE, ATTACHED
CUP HOLDER BRACKET, IGO0 NUMBER 424

SK NUMBER 00-0482200

0060 LAMP, FLUORSCENT, TWIST, MEDIUM
SCREW BASE, 120 VOLT 15 WATT

SYLVANIA NUMBER CF1SEL/TWIST

SK NUMBERG0-048221B

0070 COOLER, WATER, 3 GALLON CAPACITY
ALL PLASTIC, FDA GRADE LINER, PUSH
BUTTON SPIGCT, BAIL HANDLE, ATTACHED
CUP HOLDER BRACKET, IGLOO NUMBER 431

6080 OIL, PENTRATING, SIXTEEN OUNCE CAN,
KRYLON NUMBER 103 LET GO. MSC NUMBER

.94

28.20

774.00

NO BiD

NG BID

NC BID

NO BID

NO BID

11.65

4,194.00




DATE: 10/13/2018

BID NO.: 50-001480686

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

Page: 3

SEALED BID

LM

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

16

141

12

13

14

18

16

17

36.00

180.00

12.00

108.00

16.00

144.00

216.00

120.00

12.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

KNQOCKER LOOOSE 100z Aero Kroil
0090 LUBRICARNT, ANTI-SEIZE, SPRAY,
REGULAR GRADE BOSTIK (NEVERSE!ZE)
NUMBER NSA-16 12.5 QUNCE CAN

0100 LINE, WEED EATER, ONE POUND DONUT,
108 SQUARE SHAPE, OREGON NUMBER 21-405

SK NUMBER 06-04500090

0110 SEALANT, PIPE THREAD, WITH PTFE
BRUSHABLE PASTE, SLOW SETTING, 4 QUNCE
BRUSH TOP JAR, LOCTITE NUMBER 20534

SK NUMBER 00-0501810 Blue Monster

0120 PADLOCK, MASTER LOCK NUMBER 5,
MIXED KEYS 36 PER CASE

SK NUMBER 00-580100

0130 SUPPORTBACK, XX-LARGE WITH LUMBAR
PAD, POWER BRIGHT ORANGE, DECADE CADET
NUMBER 46585 OR ERGODYNE NUMBER 11886.
SK NUMBER 00-0477150

0140 PADLOCK, COMMERCIAL, NUMBER 5KA,
KEYED ALIKE TO NUMBER A573 MASTER BRAD
NO SUBSTITUTIONS (DRAINAGE DEPT)

0150 BATTERY, ALKALINE, INDUSTRIAL, SIZE

D, 1.5 VOLTS, DURACELL PROCELL NUMBER
PC1300

SK 00-0588140

0160 PAIL, 5 GALLON WHITE HIGH DENSITY
POLYETHYLENE, .90 MIL THICKNESS, WITH

LID, WITH WIRE HANDLE, CENTURY BRAND OR
EQUAL

0170 Marker-PAINT, MEDIUM POINT, 4.5MM
UNI PX-20 WHITE

NO BID

NG BID

6.20

74.40

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

1.40

302.40

NO BID

NO BID




KANO LABORATORIES, INC.
SAFETY DATA SHEET

SECTION 1: PRODUCT AND COMPANY IDENTIFICATION

Product Name: AEROKROIL
Product Use: Penetrant/Lubricant for Industrial Use

Manufacturer: Kano Laboratories, Inc.

1000 E. Thompson Lane

Nashville, TN 37211
Emergency Phone Number: Chemtrec 1 (800) 424-9300
Manufacturer Phone Number: (615) 833-4101
Website: www .kanolaboratories.com
SDS Date of Preparation: June 15, 2015

SECTION 2: HAZARDS IDENTIFICATION

GHS /HAZCOM 2012 Classification:

Health Physical
Skin Irritation Category 2 Flammable Aerosol Category 2
Eye Irritation Category 2A Gas Under Pressure: Compressed Gas

Specific Target Organ Toxicity — Single Exposure
Category 3 (Respiratory Irritation, CNS)
Aspiration Hazard Category 1

Label Elements

Danger!

Flammable aerosol.

Contains gas under pressure; may explode if heated.
Causes skin irritation.

Causes serious eye irritation.

May be fatal if swallowed and enters airways.

May cause respiratory irritation.

May cause drowsiness or dizziness.

Keep away from heat, sparks, open flames, and hot surfaces. No smoking.

Do not spray on an open flame or other ignition source.

Pressurized container. Do not pierce or burn, even after use.

Avoid breathing mist, vapors or spray.

Wash thoroughly after handling.

Use only outdoors or in a well-ventilated area.

Wear protective gloves, eye protection and face protection.

IF SWALLOWED: Immediately call a POISON CENTER. Do NOT induce vomiting.

IF ON SKIN: Wash with plenty of soap and water. If skin irritation occurs: Get medical attention.
Take off contaminated clothing and wash it before reuse.

IF IN EYES: Rinse cautiously with water for several minutes. Remove contact lenses, if present and easy to do.
Continue rinsing. If eye irritation persists: Get medical attention.

Page | of 6



AEROKROIL
6/15/2015

IF INHALED: Remove person to fresh air and keep comfortable for breathing. Call a POISON CENTER if you feel
unwell.

In case of fire: Use carbon dioxide, dry chemical or foam to extinguish.

Protect from sunlight. Do not expose to temperatures exceeding 50°C/122°F.

Store in a well-ventilated place.

Store locked up.

Dispose of contents and container in accordance with local and national regulations.

SECTION 3: COMPOSITION/INFORMATION ON INGREDIENTS

Chemical Name CAS# %o
Heavy Hydrotreated Petroleum Distillates 64742-52-5 30-50
Heavy Aliphatic Solvent Naphtha 64742-95-6 30-50
64742-88-7
64742-47-8
64742-96-7
Proprietary Ingredients Proprietary 1-10
Dipropylene Glycol Monopropy! Ether 29911-27-1 1-5
Diisobutyl Ketone 108-83-8 0-15
Aliphatic Alcohol #1 Proprietary <3
Aliphatic Alcohol #2 Proprietary <3
Carbon Dioxide Propellant 124-38-9 1-15

The specific identity and/or exact percentage has been withheld as a trade secret.

I

SECTION 4: FIRST AID MEASURES

Eye: Rinse thoroughly with water for several holding the eye lids open to be sure the material is washed out. Get
medical attention if irritation develops or persists.

Skin: Remove contaminated clothing. Wash contact area thoroughly with soap and water. Get medical attention if
irritation or symptoms of exposure develop. Launder clothing before re-use.

Inhalation: Remove victim to fresh air. Give artificial respiration if needed. If breathing is difficult, oxygen should
be administered by qualified personnel. Get medical attention if symptoms develop.

Ingestion: DO NOT induce vomiting. Keep the victim calm and warm. Never give anything by mouth to an
unconscious or drowsy person. Get immediate medical attention.

Most important symptoms and effects, acute and delayed: May cause eye and skin irritation. Inhalation of
vapors or mist may cause respiratory irritation and central nervous system effects such as headache, dizziness, nausea
and vomiting. Harmful or fatal if swallowed. Aspiration into the lungs during ingestion or vomiting may cause lung
damage.

Indication of immediate medical attention and special treatment, if needed: If swallowed, get immediate
medical attention.

SECTION 5: FIRE FIGHTING MEASURES

Suitable (and Unsuitable) Extinguishing Media: Use carbon dioxide, dry chemical or foam. Water may be
ineffective but can be used to cool containers and structures.

Specific Hazards Arising from the Chemical: Contents under pressure. Keep away from heat and open flames.
Container may rupture or explode in the heat of a fire. Prolonged exposure to temperatures above 120°F may cause

cans to burst. Vapors are heavier than air and may travel along surfaces to remote ignition sources and flash back.
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Never use welding or cutting torch on or near containers (even empty) because product can ignite explosively.
Combustion products may be hazardous: Oxides of carbon, organic compounds, smoke and fumes.

Special Protective Equipment and Precautions for Fire-fighters: Wear NIOSH approved positive pressure,
self-contained breathing apparatus and full protective clothing. Cool fire exposed containers with water. Protect
against bursting cans.

SECTION 6: ACCIDENTAL RELEASE MEASURES

Personal precautions, Protective equipment, and Emergency procedures: Wear appropriate protective clothing
to prevent eye and skin contact including impervious gloves, safety goggles and respirator if needed.

Environmental precautions: Avoid release to the environment. Report spills and releases as required to
appropriate authorities.

Methods and Materials for Containment and Cleaning up: Remove all ignition sources such as open flames,
spark producing equipment, pilot lights, etc. Ventilate area. Cover with an inert absorbent material and collect into

an appropriate container for disposal.

SECTION 7: HANDLING AND STORAGE

Precautions for Safe Handling: Avoid breathing vapors, aerosols and mists. Use with adequate ventilation. Avoid
contact with the eyes, skin and clothing. Wash exposed skin thoroughly with soap and water after use. Keep product
away from heat, sparks, flames and all other sources of ignition. No smoking in storage or use areas. Do not cut,

braze, solder, grind or weld on or near containers. Contents under pressure. Do not puncture or incinerate container.

Conditions for Safe Storage, Including any Incompatibilities: Store in a cool, well ventilated area at
temperatures below 120°F. Do not store in direct sunlight. Store as a Level 3 aerosol.

SECTION 8: EXPOSURE CONTROLS/PERSONAL PROTECTION

Chemical Name Exposure Limits
Heavy Hydrotreated Petroleum Distillates 5 mg/m3 TWA OSHA PEL
5 mg/m3 TWA ACGIH TLV(inhalable fraction)
Heavy Aliphatic Solvent Naphtha 500 ppm TWA OSHA PEL (As stoddard solvent)
200 ppm TWA ACGIH TLV (as kerosene)
Proprietary Ingredients None Established
Diisobutyl Ketone 25 ppm TWA OSHA PEL
50 ppm TWA ACGIH TLV
Aliphatic Alcohol #1 50 ppm OSHA TWA PEL-
50 ppm TWA ACGIH TLV
Aliphatic Alcohol #2 100 ppm TWA OSHA PEL
50 ppm TWA ACGIH TLV
Carbon Dioxide Propellant 5000 ppm OSHA PEL-TWA
5000 ppm ACGIH TLV-TWA
30000 ppm ACGIH TLV-STEL

Appropriate Engineering Controls: Use with adequate general or local exhaust ventilation to maintain
concentrations below the occupational exposure limits. Use explosion proof electrical equipment and wiring where
required.

Personal Protective Equipment:

Page 3 of 6



AEROKROIL
6/15/2015

Respiratory Protection: If the exposure limits listed above are exceeded, a NIOSH approved respirator with
organic vapor cartridges may be used. For higher exposures, a supplied air respirator may be required. Respirator
selection and use should be based on contaminant type, form and concentration. Follow OSHA 1910.134, ANSI
Z88.2 and good Industrial Hygiene practice.

Hand protection: Impervious gloves are recommended when needed to avoid skin contact. Based on available test
data, 4H or Silver Shield gloves are suggested.

Eye Protection: Chemical safety goggles recommended.
Skin Protection: Impervious clothing as required to prevent skin contact and contamination of personal clothing.

Hygiene measures: Suitable eye wash and washing facilities should be available in the work area.

SECTION 9: PHYSICAL AND CHEMICAL PROPERTIES

Appearance: Slightly reddish liquid Odor: Solvent

packaged as an aerosol
Odor Threshold: Not available pH: Not available
Melting/Freezing Point: Not available Boiling Point/Range:  Not available
Flash Point: 132°F (55.5°C) TOC Evaporation Rate: Not available
Flammability: (Solid, Gas)  Not applicable Flammability Limits:  10.9% (aliphatic alcohol #2)

LEL: 0.7% (heavy aliphatic
solvent naphtha)

Vapor Pressure: Not available Vapor Density: Not available
Relative Density: 0.8596 Solubilities: Negligible in Water
Partition Coefficient: Not available Autoignition Not available
(N-Octanol/Water) Temperature:

Decomposition Not available Viscosity: Not available
Temperature:

SECTION 10: STABILITY AND REACTIVITY

Reactivity: None known.

Chemical Stability: Stable under normal conditions of storage or use.

Possibility of Hazardous Reactions: None known.

Conditions to avoid: Avoid heat, sparks, flames and all other sources of ignition.

Incompatible Materials: Avoid strong oxidizing agents, reducing agents, acids and bases.

Hazardous decomposition products: Combustion will produce oxides of carbon, acetone, acrid fumes and smoke.

SECTION 11: TOXICOLOGICAL INFORMATION

Potential Health Effects:
Eye: May cause eye irritation with redness, tearing and stinging.

Skin: May cause irritation with redness, rash, swelling. Prolonged or repeated contact may result in defatting and
dermatitis.

Inhalation: Inhalation of vapors or mists may cause mucous membrane and upper respiratory tract irritation and
central nervous system depression. Symptoms may include coughing, wheezing, shortness of breath, headache,

dlZZmCSS drowsmess nausea, fatloue and unconsciousness.

Ingestion: Ingestion is an unlikely route of exposure for acrosol products. Swallowing may cause gastrointestinal
irritation with abdominal pain, nausea, vomiting and diarrhea and central nervous system depression with symptoms
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including headache, dizziness, intoxication, weakness, nausea, and vomiting. Aspiration into the lungs during
ingestion or vomiting may cause lung damage.

Chronic Hazards: Prolonged or repeated exposure may cause effects on the central nervous system, kidney and
liver.

Carcinogen Status: None of the components of this product at greater than 0.1% are listed as carcinogens by
OSHA, IARC or NTP.

Acute toxicity: Toxicological testing has not been performed on this product as a mixture.

Heavy Hydrotreated Petroleum Distillates: Oral rat LD50 > 5000 mg/kg; Dermal rat LD50 > 5000 mg/kg Inhalation
rat LC50 > 2.18 mg/L/4 hr.

Heavy Aliphatic Solvent Naphtha: Oral rat LD50 > 5000 mg/kg; Dermal rabbit LD50 >2000 mg/kg; Inhalation rat
LC50 > 5.28 mg/L/4 hr.

Proprietary Ingredients: Oral rat LD50 2760 mg/kg; Dermal rabbit LD50 >2000 mg/kg

Diisobutyl Ketone: Oral rat LD50 5233 mg/kg; Dermal rat LD50 > 2000 mg/kg; Inhalation rat LC50 14.5 mg/L/4 hr.
Aliphatic Alcohol #1: Oral rat LD50 3002 mg/kg; Dermal rat LDS0 > 1875 mg/kg; Inhalation rat LC50> 7.6 mg/l./4
hr.

Aliphatic Alcohol #2: Oral rat LD50 > 2830 mg/kg; Inhalation rat LC50 24.6 mg/L/4 hr.; Dermal rabbit LD50 >
2000 mg/kg

Carbon Dioxide: Inhalation rat LC50 167857 ppm/4 hr

SECTION 12: ECOLOGICAL INFORMATION

Ecotoxicity: No toxicity data available for the product.

Heavy Hydrotreated Petroleum Distillates: 96 hr. LC50 Pimephales promelas > 100 mg/L; 48 hr. EC50 daphnia
magna>1000 mg/L; 72 hr. EC50 Pseudokirchnerella subcapitata > 100 mg/L

Heavy Aliphatic Solvent Naphtha: 96 hr. LC50 Oncorhynchus mykiss 2 5 mg/L; 48 hr. EC50 daphnia magna 1.4
mg/L; 72 hr. EC50 Pseudokirchnerella subcapitata 1 3 mg/L

Proprietary Ingredients: 96 hr. LC50 Oncorhynchus mykiss 18350 ug/L

Diisobutyl Ketone: 96 hr. LC50 Oncorhynchus mykiss 30 mg/L; 48 hr. EC50 daphnia magna 37.2 mg/L, 72 hr.
EC50 Pseudokirchnerella subcapitata 46.9 mg/L

Aliphatic Alcohol #1: 96 hr. LC50 Oryzias latipes >100 mg/L; 48 hr. EC50 daphnia magna >1000 mg/L; 72 hr.
EC30 Pseudokirchnerella subcapitata>1000 mg/L

96 hr LC50 Pimephales promelas 1430 mg/L; 48 hr EC50 daphnia pulex 1100 mg/L; 72 hr EC50 Pseudokirchnerella
subcapitata 1799 mg/L

Carbon Dioxide: 96 hr LC50 Oncorhynchus mykiss 35 mg/L

Persistence and Degradability: Aliphatic alcohol #1 and aliphatic alcohol #2 are readily biodegradable. Heavy
aliphatic solvent naphtha is not readily biodegradable. Heavy hydrotreated petroleum distillate is inherently
biodegradable based on structurally similar chemicals.

Bioaccumulative Potential: Aliphatic alcohol #1 has a calculated BCF of 0.5. Diisobutyl Ketone has a calculated
BCF of 7. Aliphatic alcohol #2 has a calculated BCF of 3.

Mobility in Seil: Aliphatic alcohol #1, aliphatic alcohol #2 and diisobutyl ketone have a high to very high mobility
in soil.

Other Adverse Effects: None known

SECTION 13: DISPOSAL INFORMATION

Disposal instructions: Dispose of product in accordance with all local, state/provincial and federal regulations.

Contaminated packaging: Offer empty packaging material to local recycling facilities.
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SECTION 14: TRANSPORT INFORMATION

UN Number | Proper shipping name Hazard | Packing Group | Environmental
Class Hazard

DOT Ground Consumer Commodity ORM-D

or Limited Quantity
DOT /49CFR UNI1950 Aerosols, Flammable, Limited 2.1 None None

Quantity
IMDG UN1950 Aerosols, Limited Quantity 2.1 None None
IATA UN1950 Aerosols, Flammable, Limited 2.1 None None

Quantity

Transport in bulk (according to Annex IT of MARPOL 73/78 and the IBC Code): Not applicable —
product is transported only in packaged form.

Special precautions: None known.

SECTION 15: REGULATORY INFORMATION

U.S. FEDERAL REGULATIONS:

CERCLA 103 Reportable Quantity: This product is not subject to CERCLA reporting requirements, however, oil
spills are reportable to the National Response Center under the Clean Water Act and many states have more stringent
release reporting requirements. Report spills required under federal, state and local regulations.

SARA TITLE III:

Hazard Category for Section 311/312: Acute Health, Fire Hazard, Sudden Release of Pressure

Section 313 Toxic Chemicals: This product contains the following chemicals subject to SARA Title 111 Section
313 Reporting requirements: None
Section 302 Extremely Hazardous Substances (TPQ): None

EPA Toxic Substances Control Act (TSCA) Status: All of the components of this product are listed on the TSCA

inventory.

SECTION 16: OTHER INFORMATION

HMIS Ratings: Health -2
NFPA Ratings: Health - |

Flammability - 4
Flammability - 2

Physical Hazard - 0
Instability - 0

SDS Revision History: Converted to GHS format — all sections revised.
Date of preparation: June 15, 2015
Date of last revision: March 17, 2014

The information contained herein has been developed based upon current available scientific data. New information
may be developed from time to time which may render the conclusions of this report obsolete. Therefore, no
warranty is extended as to the applicability of this information to the user’s intended purpose or the consequences of

its use or misuse.
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Taxpavyer ldentification Number (TIN}
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However, for a resident alien, scle proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the Part | instructions on
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Certification

Under penalties of petjury, | cenify that:

1. The number shown on is foom is my correct taxpayer identification numbar {or | am waiting for 2 number to be issued to ma), and

2. tam nol

notified me that | am no longer subject 1o Dackup withhalding, and
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Purpose of Form

A person who is required to file an information return with

the IRS, must obtzin your correct taxpaysr identification

number (TIN) to report, for example, income paid to you, raal

estate yansactions, mortgage interest you paid, acquisition

or abendonment of secured property, Cancellation of debt, or

contributions you made to an IRA.

U.S. persan. Us2 Form W-S only if you sre a U.3. person -

{including & resident alisr), to provide your comect TIN to the

person requesting it {the requaester) and, when applicable, to:
1. Centify that the TIN you are giving is correct for you are

wailing for 2 number o be issued),

- Certify that you 2rs not subject to backup withholding,
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Norresident Aliens and Fereign Entides).
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certaln types of income, However, most tzx reaties contain a
provision known 2s s “saving clause,” Exceptions specified
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the terms of the treaty article.
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