INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  11/09/2017 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00121505 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0.BOX 9

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: BASIC SUPPLY, LLC EUYER: SFOLSE

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 2-3 WEEKS

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:

BAS}QS\UPPLY, LLC

SIGNATURE: " TITLE:
{Must be signed here) . A7/ P2, . . MANAGER

PRINT OR TYPE NAW
JOHN ATKINSON

ADDRESS:
PO BOX 63066
CITY, STATE: ZIP:
LAFAYETTE, LA 70506
TELEPHONE: FAX:
() 337-769-0122 () 337-247-7699

EMAIL ADDRESS:

charlotte@basicsupply.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § __/02-20




DATE: 11/09/2017

BID NO.: 50-00121505

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

6.00

6.00

6.00

20.00

30.00

2,000.00

200.00

300.00

10.00

4.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

LF

LF

EA

EA

EA

SUPPLIES FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH WB
SEWERAGE WAREHOUSE

0010 - BELT, 5VX850, GATE SUPER HC
SK NUMBER 00-0040100

0020 - BELT, NAPA, NO. 3VX560 PREMIUM
INDUSTRIAL

SK NUMBER 00-0041300

0030 - FLANGE, BLIND, 6 IN., 150 LB.

MILD STEEL F6BD

SK NUMBER 00-0076020
0040 - BUSHING, HEX, 1/4 INCH X 1/8
INCH, GRADE NO. 316 STAINLESS STEEL,
150 LB. THREADED FITTING
SK NUMBER 00-028992A
0050 - BUSHING, HEX, 3/8 INCH X 1/4
INCH, GRADE NO. 316 STAINLESS STEEL,
150 LB. THREADED FITTING
SK NUMBER 00-028996A
0060 - TUBING, POLY-FLO, 1/4 IN. OD,
IMPERIAL-EASTMAN NO. 44-P-1/4,
NATURAL COLOR, FASTENAL NO. 0400840
SK NUMBER 00-0304460

T16005001

0070 - TUBING, COPPER, REFRIGERATION,
SOFT, 1/4 IN. OUTSIDE DIAMETER

SK NUMBER 00-0384320 Mueller REF
0080 - NUT, HEX, 5/16 INCH - 18,

NO. 316 STAINLESS STEEL

SK NUMBER 00-0411100

0090 - ADAPTER, FEMALE, PVC, SCHEDULE
80, 2 IN., SOCKET X FEMALE THREAD, MUST
BE CONSTRUCTED AS ONE PIECE
(ELECTRICAL CONDUIT FITTINGS ARE

NOT ACCEPTABLE)
SK NUMBER 00-0690900

0100 - FLANGE, BLIND, 8 INCH, 150 LB.
MILD STEEL, FASTENAL NO. 0468071

F8BD

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

28.13

168.78

1.70

34.00

1.95

50.50

0.07

140.00

0.62

124.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

46.14

184.68




DATE: 11/09/2017

Page: 6
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00121505 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER QUANTITY U/m DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
SK NUMBER 00-0076030
NO BID NO BID
1 12.00 EA 0110 - ELBOW, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 90

DEGREE, 1-1/2 IN., FEMALE SOCKET X
FEMALE SOCKET, ELECTRICAL CONDUIT
FITTINGS ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE, FASTENAL
NO. 0470930

SK NUMBER 00-0690120




Abbott Rubber T16005001 Lightweight Non-Toxic Tubing, 1/4
In, 400 Ft Coil L, 140 Psi, Low-Density Polyethylene

FDA Grade, suitable for use with air and water lines, use as
pneumatic control line, for use with compression style fittings.
Inside Diameter: 0.17 In

Length: 400 Ft Coil

Type: Lightweight, Non-Toxic

Material: Low-Density Polyethylene

Nominal Size: 1/4 In

Special Features: Resist To Solvents, Acids, Alkalis And
Fuels

Standards: ~ ISO 9001:2008 Certified, FDA Approved
Temperature Rating: -42 TO 125 Deg F

Usage: For Chemical Processing, Food And Beverage
Dispensing, Hospitals, Laboratories Lines, OEM Machines And
Wire Jacketing

Wall Thickness: 0.4 In

Working Pressure: 140 Psi

Mueller REF-1/4 Refrigeration Soft Coil Tubing,
1/4 In, 50 Ft L, Copper

Cleaned and sealed for liquid fed applications such
as air conditioning, ice makers, humidifiers, and
refrigeration systems. Adhere to local plumbing
codes for installation/usage.

Length: 50 Ft

Type: Refrigeration, Soft

Usage: For Use In Liquid Fed Applications Such
As Air Conditioning, Ice Makers, Humidifiers Etc
Nominal Size: 0.25 In

FEATURES

Adhere To Local Plumbing Codes For Installation
And Usage

Cleaned And Sealed
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