



Pyramid School Products

6510 N 54TH ST TAMPA FL 33610-1908

PHONE- (800) 792-2644 FAX- (813) 621-7688

E-MAIL- BIDDEPT@PYRAMIDSP.COM

October 3, 2019

Jefferson Parish
200 Derbigny Street
Gretna, LA 70053

RE: Bid # 50-128295 Games, Sports Products and Art Supplies

To whom it may concern,

Thank you for the opportunity to respond to this proposal. Our bid reference number for this project is **#50-128295**. **This number must be listed on all orders placed against this bid.** Please refer to this number when corresponding with us regarding shipments or any other matter as it may arise.

(Orders may be e-mailed to our Sales Department at orders@pyramidsp.com. For questions regarding shipments or invoices, please contact our Customer Service Department at ext. 248 or by e-mail at customerservice@pyramidsp.com.)

If you have any questions regarding the bid documents, or if you need additional information, please feel free to contact us at (800) 792-2644 ext. 233.

Please send bid tabulation/recap once an award has been made
biddept@pyramidsp.com

Sincerely,

Pyramid School Products
Bid Department

10-9



Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, Florida 33610-1908
(AC 813) 621-6446
(Toll Free) 800-792-2644
(Fax) 813-621-7688

Bid Number 50 – 128295

**ONE TIME PURCHASE OF GAMES,
SPORTS PRODUCTS AND ART SUPPLIES
FOR THE RECREATION DEPARTMENT**

10/8/2019 at 11:00am

**PLEASE SEND US
A COPY OF RECAP
THANK YOU!**

ATTENTION VENDORS!!!

**Please review all pages and respond accordingly, complying with all provisions
in the technical specifications and Jefferson Parish Instructions for Bidders and
General Terms and Conditions. All bids must be received in the Purchasing
Department by the bid due date and time.**

**Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street
General Government Building, Suite 4400
Gretna, LA 70053
Buyer Name: Brenda Bellow
Buyer Email: BBellow@jeffparish.net
Buyer Phone: (504)364-2683**

10-3
11-15

DATE: 10/01/2019

INVITATION TO BID
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Page: 1

BID NO.: 50-00128295

JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9
GRETN, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR

BUYER: BBELLOW@jeffparish.net

Bids will be received until 11:00 AM, 10/08/2019 via online at www.jeffparishbids.net or by hand delivery, USPS mail or other courier service to Purchasing Department, 200 Derbigny Street (General Government Building), Suite 4400, Gretna, LA 70053. For convenience, bidders may also submit bids in the East Bank Purchasing Department, Suite 404, Jefferson Parish Joseph S. Yenni Building, 1221 Elmwood Park Blvd., Jefferson LA 70123. However, if submitting bids on the day of bid opening, bidders must submit at the West Bank location only.

All bids submitted are subject to these instructions and general conditions and any special conditions and specifications contained herein, all of which are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting a bid, vendor agrees to comply with all provisions of Louisiana Law, as well be in compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of Ethics, applicable Jefferson Parish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113646 and/or Resolution No. 113647. A copy of these resolutions may be obtained from the Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700, Jefferson Parish General Government Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053. You may also obtain a copy by visiting the Purchasing Department webpage at purchasing.jeffparish.net and clicking on On-line forms.

All vendors submitting bids should register as a Jefferson Parish vendor if not already yet registered. Registration forms may be downloaded from <http://purchasing.jeffparish.net> and by clicking on Vendor Information. Current W-9 forms with respective Tax Identification numbers and vendor applications may be submitted at any time; however, if your company is not registered and/or a current W-9 form is not on file, vendor registration is mandatory. Further, a current W-9 form and respective Tax Identification number must be supplied upon contract execution, should you be awarded a contract and/or issued purchase order. Failure to do so may result in delay of payment.

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Delivered, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department. JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID ONLY FROM EACH VENDOR. Items bid must meet specifications. JEFFERSON PARISH will accept one price for each item unless otherwise indicated. Two or more prices for one item will result in bid rejection. Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/or complete and return the associated line item pricing forms as indicated. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event there is a difference in unit prices and totals, the unit prices shall prevail.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts or place orders on a lump sum or individual item basis, or such combination, as shall in its judgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH. Every contract or order shall be awarded to the LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, taking into consideration the CONFORMITY WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS and the DELIVERY AND/OR COMPLETION DATE

PROTESTS: Only those vendors that submit bids in response to this solicitation may protest any element of the procurement, in writing to the Director of the Purchasing Department. Written protest must be received within 48 hours of the release of the bid tabulation by the Purchasing Department. After consultation, the Parish Attorney's Office will then respond to protests in writing. (For more information, please see Chapter 2, Article VII, Division 2, Sec. 2-914.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.)

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in the quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products to be new (current) and all work must be performed according to standard practices for the project. Unless otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts will be accepted. Unless otherwise specified, all workmanship and materials must have at least one (1) year guaranty, in writing, from the date of delivery and/or acceptance of the project. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

If this bid requires a pre-bid conference (see Additional Requirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be held to allow bidders the opportunity to identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek further clarification regarding instructions. The Purchasing Department will issue a written response to bidders' questions in the form of an Addendum.

All formal Addenda require written acknowledgment on the bid form by the bidder. Failure to acknowledge an Addendum on the bid form shall cause the bid to be rejected; JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the purpose of establishing certain minimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided brand names and stock numbers are specified. Complete product data may be required prior to award.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.

Bidders are not to exclude from participation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or activity, any person in the United States on the grounds of race, color, national origin, or sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age Discrimination Act of 1975, or with respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except that any exemption from such prohibition against discrimination on the basis of religion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1964, or Title VI and VII of the Act of April 11, 1968, shall also apply. This assurance includes compliance with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final handicapped discrimination provisions contained in Section 51.55 (c), (d), (e), and (k)(5) of the Regulations. New construction or renovation projects must comply with Section 504 of the 1973 Rehabilitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American National Standard Institute's specifications (ANSI A117.1-1961).

Jefferson Parish and its partners as the recipients of federal funds are fully committed to awarding a contract(s) to firm(s) that will provide high quality services and that are dedicated to diversity and to containing costs. Thus, Jefferson Parish strongly encourages the involvement of minority and/or woman-owned business enterprises (DBE's, including MBE's, WBE's and SBE's) to stimulate participation in procurement and assistance programs.



JEFFERSON PARISH

Department of Purchasing

Michael S. Yenni
Parish President

Renny Simno
Director

June 2019

CHANGES TO JEFFERSON PARISH BIDDING PROCEDURES

The Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department would like to make vendors aware of the following changes:

DEDUCTIBLES: The Parish Attorney with concurrence of the Director of Risk Management have waived the deductible section of the Terms and Conditions for all Invitations to Bid, until further notice.

PROTESTS: Only those vendors that submit bids in response to a solicitation may protest any element of the procurement, in writing to the Director of the Purchasing Department. Written protest must be received within 48 hours of the release of the bid tabulation by the Purchasing Department. After consultation, the Parish Attorney's Office will then respond to protests in writing.
(For more information, please see Chapter 2, Article VII, Division 2, Sec. 2-914.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.)

Please contact the Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department at 504-364-2678 if you have any questions or need assistance.



CENTRALBIDDING
FROM CENTRAL AUCTION HOUSE

**5000128295 - ONE TIME PURCHASE OF GAMES, SPORTS PRODUCTS
AND ART SUPPLIES FOR THE RECREATION DEPARTMENT**
Jefferson Parish Government

Project documents obtained from www.CentralBidding.com
02-Oct-2019 11:12:15 AM



JEFFERSON PARISH

Department of Purchasing

Michael S. Yenni
Parish President

Renny Simno
Director

June 2019

CHANGES TO JEFFERSON PARISH BIDDING PROCEDURES

The Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department would like to make vendors aware of the following changes:

DEDUCTIBLES: The Parish Attorney with concurrence of the Director of Risk Management have waived the deductible section of the Terms and Conditions for all Invitations to Bid, until further notice.

PROTESTS: Only those vendors that submit bids in response to a solicitation may protest any element of the procurement, in writing to the Director of the Purchasing Department. Written protest must be received within 48 hours of the release of the bid tabulation by the Purchasing Department. After consultation, the Parish Attorney's Office will then respond to protests in writing.
(For more information, please see Chapter 2, Article VII, Division 2, Sec. 2-914.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.)

Please contact the Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department at 504-364-2678 if you have any questions or need assistance.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT TO ALL VENDORS

This electronic procurement system allows vendors the convenience of reviewing and submitting bids online. This is a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only. Bidders are encouraged to submit electronically using this free service; while the website accepts various file types, one single PDF file containing all appropriate and required bid documents is preferred. Bidders submitting uploaded images of bid responses are solely responsible for clarity. If uploaded images/documents are not legible, then bidder's submission will be rejected. Please note all requirements contained in this bid package for electronic bid submission.

Please visit our E-Procurement Page at www.jeffparishbids.net to register and view Jefferson Parish solicitations. For more information, please visit the Purchasing Department page at <http://purchasing.jeffparish.net>.

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.

13

1. All bidders must attend the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and will be required to sign in and out as evidence of attendance. In accordance with LSA R.S. 38:2212(I), all prospective bidders shall be present at the beginning of the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and shall remain in attendance for the duration of the conference. Any prospective bidder who fails to attend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited from submitting a bid for the project.
2. Attendance to this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not relieve the bidder of responsibility for information discussed at the conference. Furthermore, failure to attend the pre-bid conference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing materials or performing any work that may be required to complete the work in accordance with the specification with no additional cost to the owner.
3. Contractor must hold current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Department of Inspection and Code Enforcement. Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH Department of Inspection and Code Enforcement. The contractor shall be responsible for the payment of these permits. All permits must be obtained prior to the start of the project. Contractor must also hold any and all applicable Federal and State licenses. Contractor shall be responsible for the payment of these permits and shall obtain them prior to the start of the project.
4. A LA State Contractor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et. seq. and such license number will be shown on the outside of the bid envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected. Additionally if submitting the bid electronically, then the license number must be entered in the appropriate field in the Electronic Procurement system. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.
5. It is the bidder's responsibility to visit the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.
6. Job site must be clean and free of all litter and debris daily and upon completion of the contract. Passageways must be kept clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at all times. Flammable material must be removed from the job site daily because storage will not be permitted on the premises. Precautions must be exercised at all times to safeguard the welfare of JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

7. **PUBLIC WORKS BIDS:** All awards for public works in excess of \$5,000.00 will be reduced to a formal contract which shall be recorded at the contractor's expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. A price list of recordation costs may be obtained from the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. All awards in excess of \$25,000.00 will require both a performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the performance bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Unless otherwise state in the bid specifications, the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Both bonds shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.
8. **NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS:** A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.
9. **NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS:** A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.
10. All bidders must comply with the requirements stated in the attached "Standard Insurance Requirements" sheet attached to this bid solicitation. Prior to contract executions/purchase order issuance, the successful bidder will be required to provide final insurance certificates which shall name Jefferson Parish as an additional insured in accordance with the instructions in the aforementioned "Standard Insurance Requirements" sheet.
11. A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications. Acceptable forms shall be limited to cashier's check, certified check, or surety bid bond. All sureties must be in original format (no copies). If submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an electronic bid bond through the respective online clearinghouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the electronic bid solicitation on Central Auction House. No scanned paper copies of any bid bond will be accepted as part of the electronic bid submission.
12. This is a requirements contract to be provided on an as needed basis. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no representations on warranties with regard to minimum guaranteed quantities unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications.
13. Freight charges should be included in total cost when quoting. If not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be quoted as a separate item. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not indicated on bid form.
14. **PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required;** This applies to all solicitations for construction, alteration or demolition of public buildings or projects, in conformity with the provisions contained in LSA-RS 38:2212.9, LSA-RS 38:2212.10, LSA-RS 38:2224, and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Non-Conviction Affidavit, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and E-Verify Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitled PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.
15. **NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required** in conformity with the provisions contained in LSA - RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Non-Collusion Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and Campaign Contribution Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitled NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.
16. The ensuing contract for this bid solicitation may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement and/or Federal funding/reimbursement. As such, the referenced appendix will be applicable accordingly and shall be considered a part of the bid documents. All applicable certifications must be duly completed, signed and submitted with bid submission. Failure to submit applicable certifications with bid submission will result in bid rejection.

It shall be the duty of every parish officer, employee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission; and the duty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every applicant for certification of eligibility for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, inspection, performance review, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Section 2-155.10(19). By submitting a bid, vendor acknowledges this and will abide by all provisions of the referenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.

DATE: 10/01/2019

INVITATION TO BID
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Page: 4

BID NO.: 50-00128295

JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9
GRETN, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR

BUYER: BBELLOW

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

21-30 days

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: _____
NUMBER: _____
NUMBER: _____
NUMBER: _____

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) _____

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***	
FIRM NAME:	<u>Pyramid School Products</u>
SIGNATURE: (Must be signed here)	<u>[Signature]</u>
PRINT OR TYPE NAME:	<u>Pyramid School Products</u>
ADDRESS:	<u>6510 North 54th Street</u>
CITY, STATE:	<u>Tampa, Florida 33610-1908</u>
ZIP:	<u>(AC 813) 621-6446</u>
TELEPHONE:	<u>(Toll Free) 800-792-2644</u>
FAX:	<u>(Fax) 813-621-7688</u>
EMAIL ADDRESS:	<u>biddept@pyramidsp.com</u>

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: \$ 1265.55

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00128295

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
1	1.00	ONLY	ONE TIME PURCHASE OF GAMES, SPORTS PRODUCTS AND ART SUPPLIES FOR THE RECREATION DEPARTMENT 0001 Deluxe Space Saver Drying Rack Artwork dries flat with no drips, even when space is at a premium. Includes 25 sliding 10 inch by 14 in trays. 41 1/2in H by 15 5/16in W by 10 1/4in D Brand: Colorations Item No: SAVESPC	NO	BID
2	4.00	EA	0002 Cleaning Time Playset. Six piece playset gives kids all the housekeeping tools they need to keep their play space clean. Broom, mop, duster, dust pan, and hand brush are comfortable and easy to store, just hang them from the sturdy cords onto the stand. Measures 28in by 4 1/2 in by 11in Brand: Melissa and Doug Item No: 8600	NO	BID
3	4.00	EA	0003 Birch Dress-Up Storage Unit. Extra storage space makes this a real must-have. 4 side shelves, room on top, and 3 top-mounted coat hooks. Comes fully assembled. 48inW by 15inD by 36inH Brand: Children's Factory Item No: ANG1076	NO	BID
4	4.00	PK	0004 Excellerations Cloud Clay. Cloud Clay is soft, puffy, light-as-air clay in 5 vibrant colors: Neon Green, Neon Pink, Neon Orange, Neon Purple, and Neon Yellow. 8 4/5 ounce tubs with lids. Non-toxic, 5 pack. Brand: Excellerations Item No: CLOUDBIG	NO	BID
5	3.00	PK	0005 Wescott Soft Handle Scissors, 12pk Comfortable soft handle is great for kids. Suitable for right or left handed use. Includes 3 each of pink, green, yellow and blue. 12 per pack. 5 inch Brand: Wescott Blunt tip Item No: 14726-PARENT	10.68	32.04
6	14.00	ROLL	0006 Pacon Banner Paper. All-purpose banner paper roll is 20	12.85	181.30

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa Florida 33610-1908

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00128295

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			pound, smooth, white bond paper. Perfect for murals, arts and crafts, signs, banners, and displays. Accepts a wide variety of mediums including paints and markers. Roll size is 36 in by 75 ft. Brand: pacon Item No: P5025		
7	8.00	PK	0007 Poster Board, White. 25 pack Value pack of poster board offers a	NO	AD
			solution for signs, mounting, bulletin boards, and so much more. 11in by 14in size, 12pt board, pack of 25. Brand: School Smart Item No: 1371698		
8	9.00	PK	0008 Scratch Brite Metallic Scratchboard Heavy-duty pre-inked scratchboard with	26 ⁹⁵	242 ⁵⁵
			gold and velvety black coating. 8 1/2in by 11in sheets. Metallic Gold. 50 pack. Brand: Scratch-Art Item No: unknown # 8093		
9	12.00	PK	0009 Crayola Washable Sidewalk Chalk Comes in a variety of different colors,	29 ⁵	35 ⁴⁰
			shaped like crayons. The large sticks of color are great for sidewalk play. Spray away with water to clean. Assorted colors, set of 24. Brand: Crayola Item No: 5120240007		
10	4.00	PK	0010 Colored Pencils, pack of 144 Thick 3.3mm lead, full size 7 inch	18 ⁹⁵	75 ⁸⁰
			pencils are pre-sharpened, non-toxic, and waterproof. Pack of 144 contains 18 each of 8 colors: red, Yellow, Blue, Green, Orange, Purple, Black, and White. Brand: School Smart Item: 411453 Salem 22-7201		
11	1.00	PK	0011 Royal Brush Cleaning Tools Value Pk Large assortment of cleaning tools for	NO	AD
			the whole class. Each tool has sharp edges to neatly smooth, trim and clean your clay pots and other ceramic creations. Includes bonus of 24 synthetic sponges perfect for smoothing and finishing clay projects. 72pcs total -48 cleaning tools and 24 sponges. Brand: Royal Brush Item No: Unknown		

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa Florida 33610-1908

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00128295

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
12	2.00	PK	0012 Amaco F-Series Glaze Classroom Pack 12-color set, 1 pint each of Jet Black, Clear Transparent, White, Royal Blue, Turquoise, Chocolate, Chrome Green, Rose Burgundy, Red, Lemon Yellow, and Orange. Brand: Amaco Item No: 39191T	159 ⁰⁰	318 ⁻
13	2.00	PK	0013 Mayco Foundation Glazes Opaque Gloss Glazes that are safe for artists of all ages. Easy to use, firing range of 06 to 6, intermixable for custom colors and glaze combinations. Lead free. pack of 12. 1 pint of each: White, Yellow, Orange, Red, Pink, Purple, Bright blue, Dark Blue, Green, Medium Green, Brown, Black. Brand: Mayco Item No: unknown	NO	BD
14	2.00	PK	0014 Amaco Opalescent Glaze Classpack Opaque glazes with a glossy iridescence. One pint each of: Bluebell, Aquamarine, Sapphire Blue, Turquoise, Autumn Leaf, and Fuchsia. Pack of 6. Brand: Amaco Item No: 39199C	NO	BD
15	4.00	PK	0015 Childcraft Basic Nutrition Food Set Promote cognitive and social development with tasty-looking items from each food group. Great for sorting, counting, and pretending. Steak measures approximately 6 inches. 44 pieces per pack. Brand: Childcraft Item No: 074667	NO	BD
16	4.00	PK	0016 Melissa and Doug Role Play Costumes These community worker costumes will expand children's knowledge of these important jobs. Each costume comes with 5-8 essential accessories for the job, a place to keep them handy, and a name tag for personalizing. Set of 4: Firefighter Construction Worker, Medic, Police. Brand: Melissa and Doug Item No.: Unknown	NO	BD
17	4.00	PK	0017 Melissa and Doug Fantasy Costumes This set is sure to inspire amazing	NO	BD

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa Florida 33610-1908

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00128295

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
18	1.00	PK	adventure. Durable wipe-clean accessories add to the fun, taking dress-up to the next level. Costumes are adjustable, and easy to take on and off. Set of 4: Pirate, Astronaut, Magician, and Princess. Brand: Melissa and Doug Item No: Unknown	51.98	51.98
19	1.00	PK	0018 Champion Sports Rhino Skin Dodgeball Colorful and soft dodgeballs are a perfect teaching tool to learn kicking, throwing and bouncing skills for any sport or game. The softness of the ball eliminates the fear of being hurt if hit 6Inch balls, set of 6, Purple, Blue, Red, Orange, Green, Yellow. Brand: Rhino Sports by Champion Sports Item No: RXD6SET	55.98	55.98
20	1.00	PK	0018 Champion Sports Rhino Ultra Foam 29 inch Bat and Balls. Perfect blend of safety and performance, this set provides just the right amount of flexibility and resistance. Rhino foam covering prevents injury to young athletes and the ribbed grip makes the bat easy to control. Color coded bats and balls. Set of 6: Red, Blue, Green, Purple, Yellow, Orange. Brand: Rhino Sports by Champion Sports Item No: SB29SET	63.98	63.98
21	2.00	PK	0020 Champion Sports Extreme Soccer Portable Pop Up Goals. These portable pop up goals are designed with poly/steel frame construction and gusseted, nylon corners. Elastic anchor tethers and hook-n-loop fasteners to hold in folded position. Polyester net, 8mm mesh, 3 nylon anchor pegs per goal. Polyester carrying bag included. Large goal: 72 in by 42in by 42in. Set of 2. Brand: Champion Sports Item: SG7240	35.95	71.90
			0021 Scooter Hockey Set Enjoy fast indoor action. Seated on scooter boards, children hit foam ball or plastic puck to score. Includes 12 sticks (6 red, 6 yellow), 7 inch foam ball, and 2 pucks. Brand: S&S Worldwide		

(AS SPEC.)

Champion

#FHSSET

+ RD7+HP

* Champion Sports Catalog View *

@ www.championsports.com

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa Florida 33610-1908

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00128295

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
22	10.00	PK	Item No: W2555 0022 Football Fun Helmets, Decorate with your favorite team's emblem. 4 1/2 in by 6 in by 4 1/2 in. Pack of 12. Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: GP1764	NO BID	
23	5.00	EA	0023 Don't Break The Ice Game Players take turns using mallets to tap out the blocks of ice one by one. Brand: Hasbro Item No: C2093	NO BID	
24	12.00	EA	0024 Uno Card Game America's number 1 card game. Easy to learn, always unpredictable, and never dull. Brand: Mattel Item No.: unknown	NO BID	
25	6.00	PK	0025 Eastern Bluebird Painting. Paint this realistic drawing of the Eastern Bluebird on stretched canvas with the included paints. 6 1/2 inch square. Pack of 12. Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: GP3333	NO BID	
26	6.00	PK	0026 American Goldfinch Painting Paint this realistic drawing of the American Goldfinch on stretched canvas with the included paints. 6 1/2 inch square. pack of 12. Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: GP3279	NO BID	
27	10.00	PK	0027 Stained Glass Headbands Turn one-of-a-kind plastic headbands into wearable art. One size fits most. Pack of 24. Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: SG853	NO BID	
28	20.00	PK	0028 Stained Glass Cars Rev up the fun! Great gifts for race fans. 5 3/4 inch W by 2 in H. 4 each of 3	NO BID	

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa Florida 33610-1908

DATE: 10/01/2019

Page: 10

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00128295

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
29	1.00	PK	designs. pack of 12. Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: SG852 0029 Jewelry Findings. Bead Chain 3.5in Pack of 50. Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: BE1219	NO	BD
30	30.00	PK	0030 Award Medals. Four each of gold, bronze, and silver colored plastic medals on ribbon lanyards with breakaway closures. Medals are 2 1/8 inch. pack of 12. Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: SL2271	NO	BD
31	8.00	PK	0031 Shaped Button Assortment Wonderful mix of sizes, shapes and bright colors. Approximately 400 pieces per 1 pound bag. 5/8inch to 1 3/16inch. Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: BE1069	NO	BD
32	8.00	PK	0032 Dense Pom Poms bag of 1,000 pom poms in ultra-dense material- almost resembling 'felted' balls. 1.5cm poms (almost 5/8inch) Perfect for any craft project. Brand: S&S Worlwide Item: FA3449	NO	BD
33	9.00	PK	0033 'I AM' Collages Kit allows each person to create his/her own collage that describes who they are with words and the shape of their hand. Finished project measures 9in by 12in. Background design is printed on cardstock. All supplies and instructions are included. Pack of 24. Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: GP3326	NO	BD
34	33.00	PK	0034 Creativity Street Wiggly Eyes 7mm Black paste-on wiggly eyes in convenient stacking containers that screw together for easy, portable, mess-free storage. Size 1/4inch (7mm), 100 pcs per pack. Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: TR252	195	64.35

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa Florida 33610-1908

Creativity Street
AC3471-02

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00128295

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
35	33.00	PK	0035 Creativity Street Wiggly Eyes 10mm Black paste-on wiggly eyes in convenient stacking containers that screw together for easy, portable, mess-free storage. Size 3/8 inch (10mm). 100 pcs per pack. Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: TR253 <i>Creativity Street AC 347202</i>	<i>2.19</i>	<i>72²⁷</i>
36	15.00	PK	0036 Stained Glass Pendants Twelve each of flower, circle, heart, and square. 1 3/4 inch. Cord included. Pack of 48 Brand: S&S Worldwide Item No: SG851	<i>NO</i>	<i>AD</i>
37	5.00	PK	0037 Bright Sequin Assortment Add glitz and glamour to any project. 1.75 ounces per bag. 12 bags per pack. Assorted colors and sizes (6-8mm) Brand: Fun Express Item No: 48/832	<i>NO</i>	<i>AD</i>
38	10.00	PK	0038 Bulk Feather Assortment Assorted colored feathers, 2 3/4 inch. 600 pcs per pack. Brand: Fun Express Item No: 48/3965	<i>NO</i>	<i>AD</i>
39	15.00	PK	0039 Flip Flop Suncatchers Accessorize your window with these plastic suncatchers. 4 inch. Pack of 12. Brand: Fun Express Item No: 48/4332	<i>NO</i>	<i>AD</i>
40	6.00	PK	0040 DIY Unfinished Wood Pohot Block 3 inch cubes with 4 inch black wire photo holders. pack of 12. Brand: Fun Express Item No: 57/1071	<i>NO</i>	<i>AD</i>
41	20.00	PK	0041 DIY Wood 'Look Its Me' Craft Sticks These quality sticks are 6 5/8 inch with a 2 1/4 inch by 3 inch shape. Includes 12 girls and 12 boys. Wood. Pack of 24 brand: Fun Express Item No: 57/1031	<i>NO</i>	<i>AD</i>
42	20.00	PK	0042 Magic Color Scratch Masks. Includes 24 paper masks with elastic	<i>NO</i>	<i>AD</i>

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa Florida 33610-1908

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00128295

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
43	20.00	PK	bands and 12 scratching tools. 6 1/2 inch by 3 inch. Brand: Fun Express Item No: 57/6562 0043 DIY Half Masks. Plastic, each has an elastic band.	NO	BID
44	20.00	PK	Pack of 24. 6 inch by 3 1/2 inch. Brand: Fun Express Item No: 25/11840 0044 Color Your Own Canvas Doodle Pencil Case.	NO	BID
45	20.00	PK	A functional and fun addition to coloring supplies for the classroom. Includes zipper closure. 8 1/2in by 4in. pack of 12, assorted designs. Brand: Fun Express Item No: 13743184 0045 DIY Canvas Pot holders. Add your own design to these kitchen	NO	BID
46	10.00	PK	helpers. 7 3/4 inch. Pack of 12. Brand: Fun Express Item No: 48/2148 0046 Bright Colored Clothespins Wood clothespins, 50 pieces per pack.	NO	BID
47	5.00	EA	Assorted Colors, 2 3/8 inch. Brand: Fun Express Item No: 48/9392 0047 Under The Sea Behavior Chart Encourage good behavior in the classroom by moving the 30 included clothespins up and down the chart depending on individual student's behavior. paper. 31 pieces per unit. 19 1/2 in by 58 in. Includes grommets for hanging. Brand: Fun Express Item No: 13768622	NO	BID

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa Florida 33610-1908

PLEASE SEND US
A COPY OF RECAP
THANK YOU!

