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Karen Blasio-Miranda

Inside Sales Associate

MSC Industrial Supply Co.

524 Elmwood Park Blvd. Ste 160
Harahan, LA 70123

Cffice: (504Y) 733-4744

Faxt: (504) 733-2075

E=malil: branchhar@mscdirect.com
www,nmscdirect, com

————— riginal Message-----

From: XXX=-000X-? [mailto:XxXX-000X~-PBmscdirect.com]
Sent: Friday, February 17, 2017 10:38 2AM

To: Karen Blasio (HAR) <BlasioK@mscdirect.com>
Subiject: Scan from XXX-000X-P

Please open the attached document. This document was digitally sent te you using an
HP Digital Sending device.

DISCLAIMER:

Thiz e-mail ig intended for the use of the addressee(g) only and may contain
privileged, confidential, or propristary information that is

exempt from disclesure under law. If you are not the intended recipient, please do
not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this

communication to others. Plsase notify the sender that vou have received thig e-
mail in error by replving to the e-mail. Please then

delete the e-mail and destroy any copies of it., Thank you.
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INVITATION TO BID Page: i
DATE: 211512017 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER
BID NO.: 50-00118889 JEFFERSON PARISH

PL‘RCHAglgG DEPARTMENT

0. 8OX 8
GRETNA, LA. 70084.0008
504-384-2878

VENDOR: BUYER: SFOLSE

Side will be roceived until 11:00 AM, 2M7/2017 via fax: 504-364-2893 or via anline at www.jeffparishblds.net,

This sits (s fres for all Jofferaon Parish vandors. For additional information on registration or usa of this fres site,
please see the text box highlighting alactronic procurement.

Al hids submifted are subject to these Instructions and general conditions and any. special conditiona and spacificalions containgd
nerain, all of which are made part of this bid proposal reference, By submitting a bid, vendor agrees 1o camply with sl
Emvis%ens of Louisiana Law, as well ba in compliance with the Jefferacn Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of

this, applicable Jetferson Parish ethicel standards and Jeflerson Parish Resolution No. 113848 sndlor Resolutlon
No. 113847, A coepy of inese resolutions may be oblained from tha Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700, o
Jefiarson Parish General Government Buliding, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053, You may alao pbiain 8 copy by visiting the
Purehasing Depanment webpage at purchaging iefparishunet and dlicking on On-iine forms.

Afl vendors submilting bids should register aa a Jafierson Farish vandor if not already yet registerad, Registration forms.ma¥ bs
downlogded from hitp:purchasing jaffparish net and by clicking on Vender Informalion, Current W-8 forms with respective 1ax
identification numbars and vendor applications may bs submitted at any time; howevar, if your company is not regiatered andior

a current W-9 form Is nat on file, vendor registration is mandatory. Further, a current W-g farm and respective Tax ldentification
numbsr must be supplied upon contract execution, should you be awarded a contract and/or issued purchase order. Failurs to do
s0 may rasull in delay of pavment,

&8 par LSA-RS 47:301 8t seq., all governmntat bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Loulslana taxing body.
Quotations shail be baged on F.0.8. Deliverad, snywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Depariment,
JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID ONLY FROM EACH VENDOR. Items bid must mset specifications. JEFFERSON
PARISH will accapt one price for each item unless otherwise indicated. Twa or more prices for ane item will result in bid rejection.
Bidders are raquired to complete, sign and return tha bid form and/or complete and return the associated fing item pricing farms as
ir;d;ﬁated. The price quoted for work shall be Stated In figures. in the evant there i a difference in unlt prices and iotali, the unit prices
shall prevail,

JEFFESISON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts or place ordars on a Jump sum or individua item basls, orsuch
combination, as shall in its judgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH. Ever\Fr eontract or order shall be awardad lo the
LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, teking Into considaration the CONFORMITY WITH THE SPEGIFICATIONS and
ine DELIVERY ANC/OR COMPLETION DATE

JEFFERSON PARISH raserves the right to cancel aff or any part of an ordes if not shippad prompfly. No chargea will be allowed far
parking or cartage unless specified in the quatation. The erdar mus! not be fillad at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH
reserves the right 1o cancsl al any time and for any reason by issuing & THIRTY (30) day writien notice to tha contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH requiras ail producls 10 be new {current) and al work must ba periormad sccording 10 standard practicas for the
projecl. Unless otherwise spacified, no aftermarket parts will he accepted. Unless atherwise specifiad, ail workmanship and materials
must have al lsast one (1?_ year guaranly, in writing, from the date of defivery andfor acceptance of tha roject,  Any deviations of
alterations from the specifications must be Indicated and/or supperting documentalion supplied with bid submission.

{1 this blg requires a pre-bid conference (sas Addilional Requiremants seclion), biddars are adviged that such confarance will bs held 1o
sllow biddars the oppariunity (o identify any discrapancles in the bid specifications and seek further clarification ragarding instructions.
The Purchasing Depariment wiil 1ssua a wiittan respons# 1o bidders’ questions in the form of an Addendum.

All formal Addenda ragulre written acknowledgmem on the bid form by the bidder, Failure to acknowledpe an Addendum an the bld
?&"" xhaii ?céeuse ir;e bid to be rajectad; JEFFERSON PARISH reserves tha right to awerd bid to next lowast responsive and responsiole
idaer in this event,

USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the aurpose of
establishing certain minimum standarde of quafity. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided brand names and
stock numbers are specifiad. Camplate product dete may be requirad prior lo award.

Quantitles listed are for bidding purposes only. Actuat requirements may ba more or lass than quantities lisied.

Bidders are not to excluds from pariicipation In, deny the benefits of, or subject fo discrimination under any program of activity, any
person in the United States on the grounds of race, color, nationa! grigin, or sex; nor digcriminate on the bagis of age under iha Age
Discrimination Act of 1975, of with respact to an olfterwise qualified handicapped individual as providad In 8action 504 of the
Rehabilitation Act of 1873, or on the bagis of religion, excep? that any axan\vyl on from sdch prohibition agsinst discrimination on the
bagis of religion as provided In the Civil Rights Act of 1984, or Title VI and VI of the Act of Aprll 11, 1968, shall alsc epoly. This
assurance includes compliance with the administrative requirements of the Revanus Sharing final handicapped discrimination
provisions containad in Section 51.55 {c}, (d&. {&}, and (K){S} of the Regulations, Naw construction or rengvation projscls must comply
with Saction 504 of the 1973 Rehebilitation Adt, as amended, in eccordance with the American Nationa! Standacd Instiute's
spacifications (ANS! A6 17.1-1861),
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DATE:  2M3nR017
Pege: 2
8iD RO.: 50-00118989

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELEGTRONIC PROCUREMENT
TO ALL VENDORS

This electronic procurement system allows vendors the conventancs of ravtewln%and submitting bids online.
This I$ a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only. Bidders are encouraged to
submit electronically using this free sarvice; while the website sccepts various file types, one single PDF fils
containing all approptiate and required bid documents Is preferred. Bidders submitting uploaded images of
bid responses are solely responsible for clarity. If uplosded images/documents are not ieg;bia then bidders
submission will be rejected, Pleass nots s!l'requiir;en;aniis contained in thig bid packags for electronic bid

submiesion,

Please vialt our E-Procurement Page at www,|effparishbids.net to register and view Jefferson Parish
solicitations, For mors Infarmation, please visit the Purchasing Department page at
http:fipurchasing.jeffparigh.net.

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS 80X WITH THE
CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.

13

1. All nidders must attend the MANDATORY pre-bid confsrenca snd will be requlred to sign in and aut as evidence ¢f
gtiendance, in accordance with LSA R.8, 38:221 2(?. ail prospaciive bidders shail be present at tha baginning of the

MANDATORY pre-bid tonference and shall rémain in attendance for the duration of the conferance. prospective
bidder who falls 1o attand the conference or remain for the duration shalt be prohibited from submitting & bid for the
oroject.

2. Attendance to this pre-bid conferenca is optional. However, failure to attend tha pre-bid conference shall not
ralisve the bidder of responsibility for Infarmation discuased at the conference. Furthermore, fiilure to attend
the pre-bid conference and inspection doas not refieve the successful bidder from the necassily of furnishing
maleriats or psrforming any work that may be requirad to completa the work in accordance with the speclfication
with no additional cost to the owner.

3. Contracior must hold current applicebls JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Departmant o inspection and
Code Enforcement. Contractor shall oblain any and all permits raguired by the JEFFERSON PARIBH
Dapariment of Inspection and Cods Enforcament, Tha cantractor shall be responsibla for the payment of
thase permits. All permits must be obtained prior to ihe start of the project. Contractor must also hold any
and all appliceble Fadaral and Stale ficensas. Contractor shall be responsible for the paymant of these permits
and shall oblain them prior to the stan of the project,

4. A LA State Contractor's Licangs will be required In accordance with LEA R.8. 37-2150Q et, seq. and such licanse
number wii be shown on the outside of the bld envelope. Failura to comply will cause the bid to ba rejsctad.
Additionally if submilting the bid electronically, then the license number must be entered in the appropriate fisid
in the Electronic Procurement aystem. Failurs ta comply will cause the bid to be rejectad.

5. itis the bidder's responsibillty to vislt the job site end evaiualse the job before submitting & bid,

6. Job site must be clasn and free of alf iiter and debrls tafly and upon completion of the contract,
Passageways must ba kept clean and free of materlal, aquipment, and debris at all times, Flammable material
must be samaved from the job site daily because storage will not be permitied on the premises. Pracaulions
must be exerclsed af all times to safeguard tha waifare of JEFFERSON PARISH and the generai public,
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DATE: 214312047

Page: 3

BID NO.: 50-00118989

10.

.

12,

13.

14,

18.

18

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: Al awards for public works in excess of $5,000.00 will be reduced to a formal

contract which shall be recorgad at the contractor’s axpanse with the Clerk of Coun and Ex-Officio Recorder of

Mnrtg:gn for the Parish of Jeffarson, A price list of récordation costs may be oblained from tha Clerk of Count

and Ex-Officlo Recorder of Martgagas for the Parish of Jeflarson. All awards in excess of $25,000.00 will requlre poth 8 )

garformancs and a paymen! bond. Uniess otharwize stated In the bld specifications, the parformancs bund requiraments snall
& 100% of tha confract price, Unisss athenwise slate in the bid specifications, the payment bond raquiraments shall be 100% of

the contract price. Both bonds shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIOS: A performence band wiil be required for this bid, The amount of the bond will be
1D0% of the contract price uniass otherwise indicatad in tha spacificalions. The performance bord shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A paymant bond will be raquired for thie bid. The amount of the bond witl ba
100% of the conlract price unless otherwise indicatad in the specifications. The payment bend shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract,

Unlass stherwise stated in tha bid specifications, the sudcesstul hiddar will be required o procura stenderd ingurance policies
evidencing Parish-mandated insursnce requirements as Indicated on the attached "insurance raguirements” shesi. All bidders
must comply with the instructions In this sheel. Failure to comply will cause bid 1o be rejected.

A bic bond will be required with bid submission in the amaunt of 5% of the fotal bid, unless otherwise stated in tre bid
specifications, Accaptable forms shall ba limitad to cashler’s check, certifled check, or sure bid bond. Alf sureties must e In
original formal (no coples). If submitting a bid online, vendars must submit an elecirenic bid bond through the respective online
clearinghouss bond management system{s) 8 indicatad in the elecironic bid soficitation on Gentral Auction Hotise, No
scannad papar copies of any bid bond will be eecepted as pant of the electranic bid submission.

This is 8 requirements contract to ba provided on an as needed basis, JEFFERSON PARISH makesna
reprg?en:iaﬁons on warranties with regard to minimum guaranteed quantities unless otherwise stated in the hid
spacifications.

Fraight charges should ba included in total cosl when quoﬁgg. if not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be
qv.éoted ﬁs a gg?ra!e item. Bld may be rejected If not quoted FOB DELIVERED or  fraight charges are not
indicated on rm.

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signad and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required; This afpﬁas to all solicitations for
construction, aiteration or demolition of public buildings o projects, In conformity with the proviions contained in LBA-RS
38:2212.0, LEA-RS 38:22172,10, LSA-RS 38:2224, and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding
purgoses, afl bidders must submit with bld submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Afiidavits, including:
Non-Conviction Aidavit, Mon-Coliusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and E-Verily
Affidavit, For the convenience of vendors, il affidavits have besn combined Inte ona form entitled PUBLIC WORKS 810
AEFIDAVIT. This afldavil must be submitied in Its original format, and without materls! alteration, in order 1o be compliant and for
ina bid {0 be considered responsiva. A scanned copy of tha completed, signed and properly noterized affidavit may be submiited
with tha bid, however, the successhuf bidder must submil the osiginal affidavit in its original format and withoul material alteration
upon contract execution. Faliure to comply will reset in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves
the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and reaponsible bidder in this event.

NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Completed, Signad and Proparly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with the provisions
contained in LSA — RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-023.1 of tha Jelforson Parlsh Coda of Ordinances. For bidding purpases, 3it Diddsrs
must submit with bid submisslon COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Non-Coflusion
Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and Gampalgn Coslribution Affidavit. For the convenlence of vendors, aif affidavits have been
combined into one form snilited NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT, This affidavit must be submited in its original format, and
without material alterslion, in order 1o be compliant and for the big to be conaidered responsive, A scanned copy of the compistsd,
slﬁned,a\nd_ properly notarixed affidavit may De submitied with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original
atfidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon contract exacution. Failure to comply will resultin the bid
submissien being rejecied as non-respanistve. The Parish reserves the right to sward bid {o the rext lowest respansive and
responsible bidder in this svant.

The ensulng contract for this bid solicitatian may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement and/or Federaf funding/reimbursement. As
such, the referenced appandlx will ba applicable accordlngy and shall be considared 2 part of the bid documenis, All applicable
oarﬂﬁcangns mus! be duly completed, signad and submitisd with bid aubmission. Fallurs to submit spplicable cerifications with
ol submission will result in bid rejection,

g

It ahall bo tha duty of every gartsh officer, employee, department, agancy, special district, board, and commission: and the

duty of every contractor, su

eligibliity for 2 parlsh contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any Investigation, audit, Inspection,
arformanca raview, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Section 2-155.10{19). By aubmilting a

id, vandor acknowledges this and will mbide by il pravisions of the refarenced Jefferson Parish Code ofy

aontractor, and licensas of the parish, and the duty of every applicamt for certification of

Ordinances,

04/15
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INVITATION TO BID
DATE:  2M312047 THIE I8 NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00118989 JEFFERSON PARISH

PURGHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O.BOX 9

BGRETNA, LA, 70054-0009
504-384-2678

VENDOR: N BUYER: SFOLSE

As per LBA-RS 47:301 ot seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Loulslana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on ¥.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobelte, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Departmant.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cance! slf or any part of an arder if not shippad promptly, No charges will ta
altowad for parking or cartage unless spacified Iy quotation, The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH rossrves the right to cance! at any time and for any ressan by issuing & THIRTY {30} day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH Is expecting all products te be new and all work Ia to be done in & workman-like manner, according
to stanidard practices. Any deviations or altarations from the epecifications must be indicated and backup documentation
supplied with your quotatlon.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIFMENT AND SUPPLIES QZLLO @{_W ﬂ K"O

INDICAYE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK N 4
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (I DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK N (ﬁ' -

in the avent that addenda are issued with this bid, bldders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the hid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an sddendum on the hid form as Indicated, Fgllure to acknowledge any adﬁan& on the bid /t__ﬂpf
' n

form will rasult in kid rejection. S ) 6..“" ¢ P
v £ )
Acknowledya Recaipt of Addenda: NUMBER: of ¥4 ) o o0 b 55‘
NUMBER:
NUMBER;
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

+ ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ™

FIRM NAME: m S.Q/ A "- L{ S ..... iM
R A e e
PRINT OR TYPE NAME: /%Vz‘./ g /&

T 52 Flpaw ovdd PR Bleh Sai‘@'&.i&[)
:;:::;:Nwmka,n LA T Mo11 3

3G4-133-494d  EDI-"T12R-DoTS
EMAIL ADDRESS:
Bronchhar @ msc ditectepm

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § &» } é’ 3 3 2 \“{ “"“

v
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DATE:

24342017

BID NO.: GQ-00148088

INVITATION TQ BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

FTEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

Uk

DESCRIFTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

20.00

20.00

30.00

4.00

T2.00

T2.00

100.00

12.60

50.00

EA

€A

L8

STOUK SUPPLIES NEEDED FOR THE JEFFERSON
PARISH WB PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

0010 - BOLT, EYE, 5/8 IN X 11, 4 iK LONG

A

Quote

SHANK, FORGED GALVANIZED, WITH NUT, 6200

WLL, 2 IN THREAD LENGTH, CROSBY G-291
¥ 1043472, OUR 8TK # 27188

0020 - BOLY, EYE, M INX 10, 4 14 IN

O

Quart

LONG SHANK, FORGED GALVANIZED, WITH NUT,
7200 # WLL, WITHOUT SHOULDER,

CROSBBY 3.2, 94 SERIES # 1043879
DURSTK # 27178

$030 - CLAMP, HOSE, BTAINLESS STEEL

Quote

1 6116 IN TO 2 14 IN RANGE, HEX SCREW

{DEAL # 6328
OUR STK # 30134

0040 - CHALK, CARPENTERS, WHITE, 3 0Z

BOTTLE, IRWIN # 64804 3TRAIT- LINE

aUbiNEL

0050 - SEALANT, URETHANE FOAM INSULATION
BIG GAP FILLER, 12 OZ CAN, DOW # 157908

QUR BTK # 20692

OUR 8TK # 320250

0060 - Paint, Spray, ULTRA FLAT BLACK
ENAMEL, 12 0Z, KRYLON #1802

oo 147

0070 - Tralllc Cane, 36 in, with flag
TOP ADAPTOR, FLUCRESCENT ORANBE WATH 2

RETRORELECTORIZED WHITE BANDS {8 IN AND
4 (N WIDTH NEAR TOP OF CONE) AS PE!;&_?’%}'CQ,

D BPECS, (O 3% LCQ

OUR STOCK # 47305
0080 - Tarpaulln, MESH, POLYPROPYLENE,

QUR STK # 328384

10 FT X 12 FT FINISHED, 3/4 BASKET WEAVE
THIGKNESS 29, TENSILE 440/38%, 11 1/21N

#2 SPURE BRASS GROMMETS EVERY 12 1IN

GORNER TO CORNER ON TEN FT SIDES,
CQUR STK # 46004

G000 - Nall, SIZE S0D, GOMMON BRIGKT

WIRE, 508 CARTON, EDF # 4431300

96/19
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DATE: 21132047

BID NO.: 50-00118989

Page: 8

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

Ui

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

YNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

by

H

12

13

14

15

30.00

144.00

120.00

2408

35.00

48.00

EA

PR

OUR 5TK # 46347

0100 - CARTRIDGE, FILTER, ORGANIC
VAPOR/ACIDIAMMONIA, GMC TYPE, 10 PER

BOX, MSA PART # 484048, MUBT BE THIS
BRAND TO FIT EXISTING MSA RESPIRATORS IN
BTQCK.

OUR STX # 48409 % %ﬂ["lag‘{

0110 - INBECTICIDE, ROOM FOGGERS, DEEP
REACH, CYPERMETHRIN 1.718%, 1.6 OZ CaN,

QUR STK 8 45157A

0120 - VEST, SAFETY, REFLECTORIZED, LG
100% polyester mesh, flatweave 7 oz,

reflective stripes, yellow/lime,
Hunraacent, mests ans! clags 3, DCCULUX
PART # LUX-HSCOOL3

OUR STK # 479107 bé)olg%t b

0130 . Sprayon Bait Dressing No.SP 00807
Bravides belt geipning action that

raduces power robbing slippage
Will not giae or collect dirt and
dusgt

Does not goptain rosin or asphalt
For afl types of beits - ieather
rubbar, canvas, fabrie, ple.

14 ounca can

GUR 8TK # 48108 OOQ‘S";OJI ?:’

0140 - GLOVE, PVC COATED, SHORT BLACK
KNIT WRIST, COTTON LINED, MEMPHIS #8400

GRAINGER # 43DA36

OUR STK # 58046 O {ci ms 3

9150 - CEMENT, PVC, HEAVY 800Y, MEDIUM
BEY, GRAY, 8 O2 CAN
OUR SYK # 690048

!

: %2’*"’

ouste

[

125, G,

357

b2

:))j 0% $1%819

8115
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Pubiic Works Bid
AFFIDAVIT

STATE OF b&f} [An A

opm
PARISH/COUNTY OF *de’ﬂ

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, personally came and nppmxmd:M / )
/@W’ [ L . {Affiani} who after being by me duly sworn, deposed and said that

o o Bionr &
he/she is the fully authorized @?&M«a« of Y M(ﬁmim.

the party who submitted a bid in response to Bid Number . 1o the Parish of

SV~ our I §959

Ietferson.

Affiant {urther said;

Campaign Cantribution Disclosures

(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A Attached hereto is a list of all campaign contributions, including
the date and amount of each contribution, made to current or
former elected officials of the Parish of Jefferson by Lntity,
Affiant, andfor officers, directors and owners. including
cmployees. owning 25% or more of the Entity during the two-year
period immediately preceding the date of this affidavit or the
current term of the elected official, whichever is greater, Further,
Entity, Affiant. and/or Entity Owners have not made any
contributions to or in support of current or former members of the
Jefferson Parish Councif or the Jefferson Parish President through
or in the name of another person or legal entity, cither directly or

ndirectly.

Choice B ~ there are NO campaign contributions made which would require
disclosure under Choice A of this seetion.

Page 1 of 4 Updated: 02.27.2014
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Affiant further seid:

Debt Diselosures
(Choose A ar B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A ~ Autached hereto s a list of sll debts owed by the atfiant to any
elected or appointed official of the Parish of Jefferson. and any and
all debts owed by any elected or appointed official of the parish to

/hc Affiant,
Choice B There are NO debts which would require disclosure under Choice
A of this section,

Alfiant further smid:

That Affiant has cmployed no person, corporation.  firm, association, or ather
organization. either directly or indirectly, to secure the public contract under which he
received payment, other than persons regularly employed by the Affiant whose services
in vonnection with the construction, alteration or demalition of the public building or
project or in securing the public contract were in the regular course of their dutics for
Affiant; and

That no part of the contract price received by Affiant was paid or will be paid w any
person, corporation, firm. association, or other organization for soliciting the contract,
other than the payment of their normal compensation to persons regularly emplayed by
the Affiant whose services in connection with the construction, slteration or demolition
af the public building or project were in the regular course of their dutics for Affiant.

Affiant further said;

Affiant personally has not been convicted of. nor has he/she entered into a plea of guilty
or nolo contendere to any of the crimes or equivalent federal crimes listed below. No
individual partner, incorporator, director. manager, officer, organizer. or member, who
has a minimum of a ten percent ownership in the Bidding Entity. has been convicted ol
or has entered a plea of guilly ar nolo contendere to any of the crimes or equivalent
federal crimes listed below. A conviction of or plea ol guilty or nolo contendere to the
following state crimes or equivalent federal crimes shall permancntly bar any person or
the bidding entity from bidding on public projects:

{a) Public bribery (R.S. 14:11R)

(by  Corrupt intluencing (R.S. 14:120)
(c} Extortion (R.8, 14:66)

(d)  Money laundering (RS, 14:230)

Puge 2 of' 4 Uipdated: 02272014

@8/15



17.02.7017 11:5@:58 retarus Faxolution From branchhar@mscdirect.com For 8015847332075 10/15

A conviction of or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to the following state crimes or
equivalent federal crimes shall bar any person or the bidding entity from bidding on
public projects for a period of five years from the date of conviction or from the date of
the entrance of the ples of guilty or nolo contendere:

{a) Theft (R.8. 14:67)

{by  ldentity Theft (RS, 14:67. 16)

(<) ‘Theft of a business record (R.S. 14:67.20)

{d) False accounting (R.5. 14.70)

() Issuing worthiess checks (R.S. [4:71)

i Bank fraud (R.S. 14:71.1)

{g)  TForgery (R.S. 14:72

(hy  Contractors; misapplication of payments (R.S, 14:202)
{i) Malfeasance in office (R.S. 14:134)

The five-year prohibition provided for in this section shall apply anly if the erime was
commitied during the solicitation or execution of a contract or bid awarded pursuant to
these provisions. I evidence is submitted substantiating that a false attestation has been
made and the project must be readvertised or the contract cancelled, the awarded entity
making the false atiestation shall be responsible to the public entity for the costs of
rebidding, additional costs due 10 inereased costs of bids and any and alf delay costs duc
to the rebid or cancelfation of this project.

(The remainder of this page Is intentionally loft blaik.)

Page 3 of 4 Updated: 02272014
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Affiant further suid:

(17 Lntity is registered and participates in a status verification system to verify that ali
employees in the State of Louisiana are legal citizens of the United States or are legal
aliens.

(2) Entity shall continue, during the term of the contract. to utilize a status verification
system 1o verify the lepal status of all new employees in the State of Louisiana,

(3) Lntity shall require all subcontractors to submit 1o the Entity a sworn affidavii
verifying complisnee with statements {1) and (2).

B
Fa

Sighatur

5
Sk

/wa\”qwzfé“’”
Printed Name of Affant

SWORN AND SUBSCRIBED TO BEFORE ME
ONTHE {7 DAY OF fZbrieary 2047

]

Notary Public

". - - . 3
Fie Tas
Printed Name of Notary

137579 eiid
Notary/Bar Roll Number /

P £ L e
My commission cxpires 4‘?{ Ai b

Paged of 4 Updated: 62.27.2014
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Karen Blasio (HAR)

T

From:

Sent:
To:
Subject:

BRANCHHAR@MSCOIRECT.COM on behalf of MSC Industrial Direct
<BRANCHMAR@MSCDIRECT.COM>

Friday, February 17, 2017 10:14 AM

Branch, Harahan, LA; Leanne Smith {MOB)

Quote 18825048 for HARAHAN BRANCH, Cust # 6308553-JEFFERSON PARISH QUOTES
has been created.

QOrder Online »

Quote % 18825048

Customer

Reforence § >0-00118989
. . 89K KAREN

Qualed oy g1 410 X200 |

Phone: B888-572-8722

£xpiration

Date: 03202017

Number af 8

lines.

Quote total: $6.633.44

Customor info

) HARAHAN
Cantact: BRANCH
Phone: 504-7334744
Bill To:

JEFFERBON PARISH
QUOTES

524 ELMWOOD PARK BLVD.
STE 160

HARAHAN, LA 70123

Ship To: 08308594

JEFFERSON PARISH
QUOTES

524 ELMWOODD PARK BLVD,
STE 1860

HARAHAN, LA 70123

| MNotes

| SEE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS ON ALTERNATE
| ITEMS

Dise.
Uinat "
Pioge

. L Unit
st . N gy
Hemnd Y. price  LVSC

Litse

1 G4904/77274488 1878 4 $2.16 174% $178 $§7.12
Description: 8 OZ WHITE CHALK REFILLS

2 1602/00264747 3111 72 $7.50 35.3% $4.83 $£347.78

Description: ULTRA-FL BLK KRYLON PAINT 1602
AERSOL

3 63869705 2853 100 $20.71 0.0% $20.71$2,071.00
Dexcription: 36" ORG W/2COLLAR TRAFFIC CONE

4 88917024  none 30 $102.0340.0%%65 42%1,962.60.

Desgcription: GMC CVIAG 10/PK COMFO RESPIRATR
CARTRIDGE

5 BEO26818  none 120 $43.14 67 .5%514.0251 682.40

Bescription: LRG ORNG COOL MESH CLS 3 SHORT
SLEEVE VEST

"IN §TOCK
*SHIPS WITHIN 48 HOURS DIRECT FROM THE MFR.

6 00607/00256073 3068 24 $104550.0% $5.23 $125.52
Dascription: BELT DRESSING AERCSOL SPRAYON
im this ftem for Manufacturing use oniy?
Y

Customer First Name:
8

12715
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Customer Last Name:

FOLSE

Plaase provide today's date (e, mmiddlyyyy)
717

7 Q1902223 none 3§ $4.59 22.0% $3.58 $128.88

Dencription: SMOOTH GRIP BLK 1/PR PVC KNIT
WRIST GLOVES

N STQCK
*SHIPS WITHIN 48 HOURS DIRECT FROM THE MFR.

8 37035788 4300 48 $6.42 0.0% $6.42 $308.16
Bascription: 8 OZ, PVC CEMENT-MEDIUM CLEAR
HAZARDOUS ITEMS ARE NOQ

Thank you for allowing us the opportunity to quote your
requiraments,
Quoted prics will only be reflectad on web in the shopping options section under
quoles.

it you have any questions or concernsg, please contact MSC's WSCA Team toli-
free ot 808-672-0722 or emall us at WSCA_ ATL fEmsedirect com.
Team hours are Monday through Friday S8am-Spm,

To search, order or lsarn more about MSC, log on fo www macdiract com.

MBC TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. Unlese atherwise stated in commants or in your actaunt profile, prices quotad ere FOB
SHIPPING POINT, TEST

Frelght charges will be prepald ang added to your involice,

2. Unless gtherwise sinted in comments, stendard payment tarms are NET 36 DAYS from tha
drts of the nvoice.

3. All tterns will be manufectured to our vandors standard dimensions and tolncancas uniazs
otherwisa spacified.

4. Qur vandore reserve the right to overship of underghip by 10% or one piete. An additional
charge may be Imposed for quotss requasting axact quaniities (no aver or under} shipments.
5. Unlass atnenvise stated, this quote is valid for 30 days from tha date of the quole,

8. Unloss othorwise steted, Speclal Order ltems ara deemed non-relumeble, uniess there ig 2
manufacluring sult.

7. This purchase Is govemad exclugively ny MSC's Terms and Conditions that can be found in
‘MBC's current calalog and at www, mscdirect.com . You can view the current larms at
yew Do edirect convoustomenservicefiems . M8C's ascaptanca of your order is pradicated on
your gsgent io M3C's Terms and Conditions, untegs you have entered Into 2 separate product
purchase agreement with M3C that continuge 1o be in effect on the date of your order. Sugh
agreemen, depending upon is terms, may supersede MEC's Terms ang Condltions.

13/15
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2172047 36 Inch High, Orange, Rigld Cone with 63888796 - MSC

14715

| LineT

Save up t0 28% on orders over $219. ENTER CODE: WEB2Z5H CLICK TO APPLY ¥/ PROMO APPLIED

PRO-SAFE - 36 Inch High, Orange, Rigid Cone with Reflective Collar
13 Inch Base Width, 10 Lbs., PVC

M3C Part #: 63868786 Wil the fret raviaw

Zoom m Your Prica:

. . St e G e

; NO | Fl‘ .

Hassle Free Guarantes

+o P «d 0( @.ﬁ"c“f_-—}

p—

838 in stack
374 avaiiable to ship from Harrisburg, PA

We'll exchange or refund any product
that dossn't meat your expactations,

Specs #ROEF

Type Rigid Cona Bfaﬂd" L APR.QT‘SA.FE -
Color Orange MSCPatk  caseeres
Reflective Coliars (YesNo) ~ Yas orC# 7743007823
Helght {inch} 38 Big Bookpagewgm e e
Compliance MUTCD - R o
G e .

Spacial Characteristics 6™ & 4™ Rafiactiva Collars

'\&Qéﬁém.)” Nt A R

Collar One Widh (inch) g

Collar Two Width (nch) 4

Customers Also Viewed

hltps:/iww.macdirect. comiproduct/detalis/63880798

13
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201712017 8 Ounce Medium Bodled Cement 37035789 - MSC

Save up to 25% on orders over $218, ENTER COOE; WEB25H CLICK TO APPLY b v PROMC APPLIED

Oatay - 8 OQunce Medium Bodied Cement
Clear, For Use with PYC up to 6 Inch Diameter

Mir Part #: 31018 MSC Part #: 37035789 Yyrite tha frst raview

Your Price;

Oroar Gty of T = {1} B Ounca Can

123 24+
$751ee.  $6.78 s,

L ]
This item is hazardaus, Hazardous
products Bre non-retumnabla, not
guarantesd for same day shipping and Addte Cart | v
hava an adgitional ship chg.

Heam Notox

421 In stock

31 svailabis 1o ship from Harrisburg, PA

Oatey'

Typa Medium Bodled Cgment e e :

Container Size 8 oz, Brand: Catey

Folsewin — PvCwlegDmew  Mscrak g
Color Clmar Mfr Part 31018

el vt e il S e ek Peged 4309

‘3 ltem Is hazardous. Cuuntty of Or%glﬂ Un!ted Sta!es

Country of Origin Is subjset to change
@ This item cannol be shipped via sir carrier,

Customers Also Viewed

Oatsy Oatey Qatey Datey
MSC #: 37036118 MSC #: 370365528 MSC ¥: 30195580 MSC #: 370350861

https:/lwvm.mscdb’ect.wm/pmdu:chct:Iu137035759?hem=37036789 1"



INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  2/13/2017 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00118989 JEFEERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9
GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678
VENDOR: BUYER: SFOLSE

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work is to be done in a workman-like manner, according
to standard practices. Any deviations or alterations from the specifications must be indicated and backup documentation
supplied with your quotation.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH 0/54/17
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK By 2/20/17
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK 2 days in house

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:
NUMBER:

NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***
FIRMNAME: DP|astic Industrial Products, LLC

SIGNATURE; , TTLE: President
{Must be signed here} 7 W

PRINT OR TYPE NAME:
John Beaumont

ADDRESS: g0 Oak Street
CITY, STATE:  New Orleans, LA @ 70118

TELEPHONE: FAX:
( 504 861-1500 ( 504 865-1525

EMAIL ADDRESS: jheau@plasticindustrialproducts.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMs: § __F OB Delivered $695.00




DATE: 211312017

BID NO.: 50-00118989

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

UiM

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

20.00

20.00

30.00

4.00

72.00

72.00

100.00

12.00

50.00

LB

STOCK SUPPLIES NEEDED FOR THE JEFFERSON
PARISH WB PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

0010 - BOLT, EYE, 5/8 IN X 11, 4 IN LONG
SHANK, FORGED GALVANIZED, WITH NUT, 5200

WLL, 2 IN THREAD LENGTH, CROSBY G-291
#1043472, OUR STK # 27168

0020 - BOLT, EYE, 3/4 INX 10,4 1/4 IN
LONG SHANK, FORGED GALVANIZED, WITH NUT,

7200 # WLL, WITHOUT SHOULDER,
CROSBY G-2, 91 SERIES # 1043579
OUR STK # 27170

0030 - CLAMP, HOSE, STAINLESS STEEL
156/16 IN TO 2 1/4 IN RANGE, HEX SCREW

IDEAL # 6328
OUR STK # 30194

0040 - CHALK, CARPENTERS, WHITE, 8 0Z
BOTTLE, IRWIN # 64804 STRAIT- LINE

OUR STK # 30692

0050 - SEALANT,URETHANE FOAM INSULATION
BIG GAP FILLER, 12 OZ CAN, DOW # 157306

OQUR STK # 329250

0060 - Paint, Spray, ULTRA FLAT BLACK
ENAMEL, 12 OZ, KRYLON #1602

OUR STK # 32936A

0070 - Traffic Cone, 36 in, with flag
TOP ADAPTOR, FLUORESCENT ORANGE WITH 2

RETRORELECTORIZED WHITE BANDS (6 IN AND
4 IN WIDTH NEAR TOP OF CONE) AS PER MUTC
D SPECS.

OUR STOCK # 47905

0080 - Tarpaulin, MESH, POLYPROPYLENE,
10 FT X 12 FT FINISHED, 3/4 BASKET WEAVE

THICKNESS 20, TENSILE 440/365, 11 1/2 IN
# 2 SPURE BRASS GROMMETS EVERY 12 IN
CORNER TO CORNER ON TEN FT SIDES.
OUR STK # 48004

0090 - Nail, SIZE 60D, COMMON BRIGHT
WIRE, 50# CARTON, EDP # 4481800

No Bid

No Bid

No Bld

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$57.92
Each

$695.00

No Bid

FOB Delivered




DATE: 2/13/2017

BID NO.: 50-00118989

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: [

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

Um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

11

12

13

14

15

30.00

144.00

120.00

24.00

36.00

48.00

PR

OUR STK # 48347

0100 - CARTRIDGE, FILTER, ORGANIC
VAPOR/ACID/AMMONIA, GMC TYPE,10 PER

BOX, MSA PART # 464046, MUST BE THIS
BRAND TO FIT EXISTING MSA RESPIRATORS IN
STOCK.

OUR STK # 48409

0110 - INSECTICIDE, ROOM FOGGERS, DEEP
REACH, CYPERMETHRIN 1.716%, 1.5 OZ CAN,

OUR STK # 48157A

0120 - VEST, SAFETY, REFLECTORIZED, LG
100% polyester mesh, flatweave 7 oz,

reflective stripes, yellow/lime,

fluorescent, meets ansi ¢lass 3, OCCULUX
PART # LUX-HSCOOL3

OUR STK # 479107

0130 - Sprayon Belt Dressing No.SP 00607
Provides belt gripping action that

reduces power robbing slippage
Will not glaze or collect dirt and
dust

Does not contain rosin or asphait
For all types of beits - leather
rubber, canvas, fabric, etc.

11 ounce can

OUR STK # 49109

0140 - GLOVE, PVC COATED, SHORT BLACK
KNIT WRIST, COTTON LINED, MEMPHIS #6100

GRAINGER # 49DA36
OUR STK # 58046

0150 - CEMENT, PVC, HEAVY BODY, MEDIUM
SET, GRAY, 8 OZ CAN
OUR STK # 69001B

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




Public Works Bid

AFFIDAVIT

)
STATEOF _ _ouTqi Dadh

PARISH/COUNTY OF (0 Lo mncc

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, personally came and appeared: John

@t’? aymont , (Affiant) who after being by me duly sworn, deposed and said that
- N ;“ahj Ue f:(: "’L" (":‘
he/she is the fully authorized e don /- of (’/'5/5#‘& Tdugn a1/ (Entity),

the party who submitted a bid in response to Bid Number $o-00(/479) , to the Parish of

Jefferson.

Affiant further said:

Campaign Contribution Disclosures

(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A Attached hereto is a list of all campaign contributions, including
the date and amount of each contribution, made to current or
former elected officials of the Parish of Jefferson by Entity,
Affiant, and/or officers, directors and owners, including
employees, owning 25% or more of the Entity during the two-year
period immediately preceding the date of this affidavit or the
current term of the elected official, whichever is greater. Further,
Entity, Affiant, and/or Entity Owners have not made any
contributions to or in support of current or former members of the
Jefferson Parish Council or the Jefferson Parish President through
or in the name of another person or legal entity, either directly or
indirectly.

Choice B X there are NO campaign contributions made which would require
disclosure under Choice A of this section.

Page 1 of 4 Updated: 02.27.2014



Affiant further said:

Debt Disclosures
(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A Attached hereto is a list of all debts owed by the affiant to any
elected or appointed official of the Parish of Jefferson, and any and
all debts owed by any elected or appointed official of the parish to
the Affiant.

Choice B X There are NO debts which would require disclosure under Choice
A of this section.

Affiant further said:

That Affiant has employed no person, corporation, firm, association, or other
organization, either directly or indirectly, to secure the public contract under which he
received payment, other than persons regularly employed by the Affiant whose services
in connection with the construction, alteration or demolition of the public building or
project or in securing the public contract were in the regular course of their duties for
Affiant; and

That no part of the contract price received by Affiant was paid or will be paid to any
person, corporation, firm, association, or other organization for soliciting the contract,
other than the payment of their normal compensation to persons regularly employed by
the Affiant whose services in connection with the construction, alteration or demolition
of the public building or project were in the regular course of their duties for Affiant.

Affiant further said:

Affiant personally has not been convicted of, nor has he/she entered into a plea of guilty
or nolo contendere to any of the crimes or equivalent federal crimes listed below. No
individual partner, incorporator, director, manager, officer, organizer, or member, who
has a minimum of a ten percent ownership in the Bidding Entity, has been convicted of,
or has entered a plea of guilty or nolo contendere to any of the crimes or equivalent
federal crimes listed below. A conviction of or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to the
following state crimes or equivalent federal crimes shall permanently bar any person or
the bidding entity from bidding on public projects:

(a) Public bribery (R.S. 14:118)

(b) Corrupt influencing (R.S. 14:120)
(© Extortion (R.S. 14:66)

(d) Money laundering (R.S. 14:230)

Page 2 of 4 Updated: 02.27.2014



Affiant further said:

(1) Entity is registered and participates in a status verification system to verify that all
employees in the State of Louisiana are legal citizens of the United States or are legal

aliens.

(2) Entity shall continue, during the term of the contract, to utilize a status verification

system to verify the legal status of all new employees in the State of Louisiana.

(3) Entity shall require all subcontractors to submit to the Entity a sworn affidavit

verifying compliance with statements (1) and (2).

o & Lo

Si nature of Affiant

X )

Printed Name of Affiant

SWORN AND SUBSCRIBED TO BEFORE ME
ONTHE [ DAYOF 2017,

@)P}WJ«, QQ) (}Eﬁ Cod

Notary Public 4
%Q\C@ &s Q(JNLA
Printed Name of Notary ~J
2054 / oyany

Notary/Bar Roll Number

My commission expires ___< Foe I( f(%

J

o
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